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Amendment to Regulations under the .Motor-vehicles Act, 1924, 
as to the Equipment and Use of Motor-vehicles, as to Notices 
and Signs, and generally a, to Motor-traffic. 

BLEDISLOE, Governor-General. 

ORDER IN COUNCIL. 

At the Government Buildings at Wellington, this 11th day of 
June, 1934. 

Present: 
THE RIGHT HoN. G. W. FORBES PRESIDDCG IN CouKcIL. 

I N pursuance and exercise of the powers conferred on him 
by the Motor-vehicles Act. 1924, and of all other powers 

enabling him in that behalf, His Excellency the Governor­
General of the Dominion of New Zealand. acting hy and with 
the advice and consent of the Executive Council of the said 
Dominion, doth hereby make the following regulations in 
amendment of the Motor-vehicle Regulations, 1933 (herein­
after termed the "said regulat.ions "). 

R~~GULATIONS. 

l. THESE regulations may be cited as the Motor-vehicle 
Regulations Amendment No. 2. 

2. Clanse (13) of Regulation II of the said regulations is 
hereby revoked, and the following clause substituted 
therefor:~ 

"(13) Every driver of a motor-vehicle, when approaching 
any intersection the traffic at which is not for the time being 
controlled by a police officer. traffic inspector, or the presence 
of a compulsory stop sign, and to which any other vehicle 
(inclusive of trams) is approaching, so that if both continued 
on their course there would be a possibility of collision, shall, 
if such vehicle (being other than a tram) is approaching irom 
his right, or if such vehicle (being a tram) is approaching from 
any direction, give way to such other vehicle, and allow the 
same to pass before him, and, if necessary for that purpose, 
stop his vehicle. and no drirnr of a motor-vehicle shall increase 
the speed of bis vehicle when approaching any intersection 
under the circumstanees :-;et out in this clause.,, 

F. D. THOMSON, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 
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