
Nov. 17.] THE NEW ZEALAND GAZETTE. 

7. Subclause (2) of clause 11 is hereby amended by deleting the amount 
" £65," and by substituting therefor the amount "£85." 

8. (1.) Subclause (1) of clause 12 is hereby amended by adding to para­
graph (a) the following words: "or have gained a 'partial pass' in accord­
ance with regulations in the Class D Certificate Examination." 

(2.) Subclause (2) of clause 12 is hereby amended by deleting the amount 
" £45," and by substituting therefor the amount " £65." 

9. (1.) Clause 33 is hereby amended by adding the following subclause :-
" (4.) Any person who, having been a member of the New Zealand Expe­

ditionary Force as aforesaid, is not eligible for admission a~ a student or 
for appointment as a supernumerary teacher in accordance with any other 
provisions of these regulations, may be admitted as a student to any training 
college or be appointed a supernumerary teacher on such conditions as to 
qualifications or otherwise and subject to the payment of such allowances 
as may be approved by the Director of Education." 

(2.) The said clause is hereby further amended by deleting the amount 
"£120-£150" in subclause (1), and by substituting therefor the amount 
"£140-£170 " ; and by deleting the amount " £120 " in subclause (2), 
and by substituting therefor the amount "£140." 

10. Clauses 2 and 3, and subclause (1) of clause 8, and subclause (1) of 
clause 9 of this Part of these regulations shall come into force on the date 
of the first publication of this Order in the New Zealand Gazette. 

PART X.--ORGANIZING TEACHERS. 

1. The Regulations for Organizing Teachers made by Order in Council 
dated the 29th April, 1919, and gazetted the 8th May, 1919, are hereby 
amended as follows :-

(1.) By adding the following clause :-
" 8. An organizing teacher shall receive a salary of £340-£380, 

together with house allowance at the rate of £50 per annum." 
(2.) By inserting the words "the Education Board and" as follows: 

(a) After the words "approval of" in paragraph (d) of clause 1 ; 
(b) after the words "approval of," and also after the words 
"approved by," in clause 2 ; (c) after the words "each month 
to " in clause 3. 

(3.) By deleting the words " by that section" in clause 6, and by sub­
stituting therefor the words "by clause 8 hereof." 

2. Subclause (1) of clause 1 of this Part of these regulations shall be 
deemed to have been in force on and afier the 8th Mav, 1919. Sub­
clauses (2) and (3) shall come into force on the date of the first publication 
of this Order in the New Zealand Gazette. 

F. W. FURBY, 
Acting Clerk of Executive Council. 

Hy Authority : M.rnrns F MARKS, Government Printer, Wellington 

3503 


