Reprint
as at 18 December 2013

Sale of Liquor Amendment Regulations 2007
(SR 2007/41)

Sale of Liquor Amendment Regulations 2007: revoked, on 18 December 2013, pursuant to regulation
43(a) of the Sale and Supply of Alcohol Regulations 2013 (SR 2013/459).

Preamble

At Wellington this 26th day of February 2007

Pursuant to section 229 of the Sale of Liquor Act 1989, His Excellency the Governor-
General, acting on the advice and with the consent of the Executive Council, makes
the following regulations.

Contents
Page

1 Title 1
2 Commencement 1
3 Principal regulations amended 1
4 Fees payable to District Licensing Agency 1
1 Title

These regulations are the Sale of Liquor Amendment Regulations 2007.
2 Commencement

These regulations come into force on 1 April 2007.
3 Principal regulations amended

These regulations amend the Sale of Liquor Regulations 1990.

4 Fees payable to District Licensing Agency
(1)  Regulation 29(2) is amended by omitting “$248” and substituting “$124”.

Note

Changes authorised by subpart 2 of Part 2 of the Legislation Act 2012 have been made in this reprint. See the
notes at the end of this reprint for further details.

These regulations are administered by the Ministry of Justice.


http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM5737137
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM5737137
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM167524
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM165115
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM135470
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM135980
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998524

Reprinted as at
Explanatory note Sale of Liquor Amendment Regulations 2007 18 December 2013

(2)  Regulation 29(3) is amended by omitting “$42” and substituting “$21”.
Diane Morcom,

Clerk of the Executive Council.

Explanatory note
This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect.

These regulations, which come into force on 1 April 2007, amend the Sale of Liquor
Regulations 1990 (the principal regulations).

Under the principal regulations, an applicant for a liquor licence pays the appropriate
District Licensing Agency a prescribed fee. The amendments halve the amount of that
fee that is then payable by a District Licensing Agency to the Licensing Authority.

Issued under the authority of the Legislation Act 2012.
Date of notification in Gazette: 1 March 2007.


http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM135980
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM135470
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM135470
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2997643

Reprinted as at
18 December 2013 Sale of Liquor Amendment Regulations 2007 Notes

Reprint notes

1 General

This is a reprint of the Sale of Liquor Amendment Regulations 2007 that
incorporates all the amendments to those regulations as at the date of the last
amendment to them.

2 About this reprint

This reprint is not an official version of the legislation under section 18 of the
Legislation Act 2012.

3 Amendments incorporated in this reprint
Sale and Supply of Alcohol Regulations 2013 (SR 2013/459): regulation 43(a)


http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998516
http://legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM5737137

