
Radiation Protection Amendment Act 1997
Public Act 1997 No 53

Date of assent 28 July 1997
 

Radiation Protection Amendment Act 1997: repealed, on 7 March 2017, pursuant to section 96 of the
Radiation Safety Act 2016 (2016 No 6).

Contents
Page

Title 1
1 Short Title 1
2 Offences 1

An Act to amend the Radiation Protection Act 1965

BE IT ENACTED by the Parliament of New Zealand as follows:
 

1 Short Title
This Act may be cited as the Radiation Protection Amendment Act 1997, and is
part of the Radiation Protection Act 1965 (“the principal Act”).

2 Offences
(1) Section 26(2) of the principal Act is amended by omitting the expression

“$200”, and substituting the expression “$10,000”.

Note
Changes authorised by subpart 2 of Part 2 of the Legislation Act 2012 have been made in this eprint. See the
notes at the end of this eprint for further details.

This Act is administered by the Ministry of Health.

Reprint
as at 7 March 2017

1

http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM6339755
http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM372538
http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM372538
http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM373144
http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998524


(2) Section 26(2) of the principal Act is amended by omitting the expression
“$10”, and substituting the expression “$500”.

s 2 Radiation Protection Amendment Act 1997
Reprinted as at
7 March 2017

2

http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM373144


Eprint notes

1 General
This is an eprint of the Radiation Protection Amendment Act 1997 that incorp-
orates all the amendments to that Act as at the date of the last amendment to it.

2 About this eprint
This eprint is not an official version of the legislation under section 18 of the
Legislation Act 2012.

3 Amendments incorporated in this eprint
Radiation Safety Act 2016 (2016 No 6): section 96

Wellington, New Zealand:

Published under the authority of the New Zealand Government—2017

Reprinted as at
7 March 2017 Radiation Protection Amendment Act 1997 Notes

3

http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998516
http://prd-lgnz-nlb.prd.pco.net.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM6339755

