
Serial Number 1943/146 

THE WAR INJURIES TO CIVILIANS EMERGENCY 
REGULATIONS 1942, AMENDMENT NO. 1 

C. L. N. NEW ALL, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington, this 31st day of 
August, 1943 

Present: 
HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Emergency Regulations Act, 1939, His Excellency 
the Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of 
the Executive Council, doth hereby make the following regulations. 

l REGULATIONS 
1. These regulations may he citcd as the War Injuries to Civilians 

Emergency Reg:\tions 1942, Amendment No. 1, and shall be read 
together with an ~emed part of the War Injuries to Civilians Emer-
gency Regulatio \1942* (hereinafter referred to as the principal 
regulations). . 

2. Regulation of the principal regulations is hereby amended as 
follows:- \ 

(a) By omitting~rom paragraph (a) of subclause (1) the expression 
" £78 ", and substituting the expression " £104 " : 

(b) :t3y omitting the expression "£104" where it first occurs in 
, paragraph (b) of subclause (1), and substituting the expression 
\ " £130" : 
(\) By omitting from paragraph (b) of sub clause (1) the expression 

" £26 ", and substituting the expression" £27 6s.". 
3. Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is hereby amended 

by omitting the expression" £26 ", and substituting the expression 
"£27 6s.".· 

4. Regulation 6 of the principal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the expression" £26 " where it first occurs, and substituting 
the expression " £39 ". 

* Statutory Regulations 1942, Serial number 1942/198, page 477. 



2 War Injuries to Civilians Emergency Regulations 
1942, Amendment No. 1 

[1943/146 

5. Regulation 7 of the principal regulations is hereby amended as 
follows :-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) of sub clause (1) the expression 
" £52 ", and substituting the expression " £78 " : 

(b) By omitting from subparagraph (i) of paragraph (b) of 
sub clause (1) the words" One hundred and four pounds ", 
and substituting the words "One hundred and fifty-six 
pounds" : 

(c) By omitting from subparagraph (iii) of paragraph (b) of 
subclause (1) the words" Twenty-six pounds ", and substi
tuting the words" Twenty-seven pounds six shillings ". 

6. These regulations shall apply with respect to every instalment 
of a pension (whether granted before or after the commencement of 
these regulations) if the instalment is payable in respect of any period 
commencing after the 30th day of June, 1943. 

C. A. JEFFERY, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act, 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 9th day of September, 1943. 
These regulations are administered in the Social Security Department. 

By Authority: E. V. PAUL, Government Printer, Wellington.-1943. 

Price 2d.] 


