585

1977/132

THE WESTPORT HARBOUR REGULATIONS 1965,
AMENDMENT NO. 5

DENIS BLUNDELL, Governor-General

ORDER IN COUNCIL
At the Government House at Wellington this 23rd day of May 1977

Present:
His ExceLLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL

PursuaNnT to section 232 of the Harbours Act 1950, His Excellency the
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations.

REGULATIONS

1. Title and commencement— (1) These regulations may be cited as
the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965, Amendment No. 5, and shall
be read together with and deemed part of the Westport Harbour
Regulations 1965* (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations).

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the day after the date
of their notification in the Gazette.

2. Expenses of pilot detained onboard—Regulation 40 of the principal
regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression “$20” (as sub-
stituted by regulation 2 of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965,
Amendment No. 3), and substituting the expression “$30”.

3. Pilotage—Regulation 47 of the principal regulations (as substituted
by Regulation 3 of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965, Amendment
No. 3) is hereby amended:

(a) By omitting the expression “2 cents”, and substituting the ex-

pression “4 cents”; and

(b) By omitting the expression “5 cents”, and substituting the expres-

sion “8 cents”.
*S.R. 1965/112
Amendment No. 1: (Revoked)
Amendment No. 2: S.R. 1968/185

1
2
Amendment No. 3: S.R. 1974/326
Amendment No. 4: S.R. 1975/125



586 Westport Harbour Regulations 1965, 1977/132
Amendment No. 5

4. Berthage—Regulation 48 of the principal regulations (as sub-
stituted by Regulation 4 of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965,
Amendment No. 3), is hereby amended:

(a) By omitting the expression “3 cents”, and substituting the ex-

pression “5 cents”’;

(b) By omitting the expression “2 cents”, and substituting the ex-
pression “3 cents”; .

(c) By omitting the expression “$5” and substituting the expression
<:$10”;

(d) By omitting the expression “$3” and substituting the expression
u$4”; and

(e) By omitting the expression “$10”, and substituting the expression
<¢$13n.

5. Warps and swinging wires—Regulation 54 of the principal regula-
tions is hereby amended by omitting the expression “$6” (as sub-
stituted by Regulation 6 of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965,
Amendment No. 3), and substituting the expression “$10”.

6. Electricity—Regulation 55 of the principal regulations (as sub-
stituted by Regulation 7 of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1963,
Amendment No. 3) is hereby amended:

(a) By omitting the expression “l1 cent” and substituting the expres-

sion “2 cents”; and

(b) By omitting the expression “$6” and substituting the expression

“$103’.

7. Charges for towing—Regulation 56 of the principal regulations (as
substituted by Regulation 8 of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965,
Amendment No. 3) is hereby amended:
(a) By q$mitting the expression “$50” and substituting the expression
[ 10033;

(b) By omitting the expression “$25” and substituting the expression
“$50”; and

(c) By %mitting the expression “$20” and substituting the expression
(13 50),.

8. Laying-up charges—Regulation 64a (1) of the principal regulations
(as inserted by Regulation 5 of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965,
Amendment No. 2 and amended by Regulation 9 of the Westport
Harbour Regulations 1965, Amendment No. 3) is hereby further
amended by revoking paragraphs (a) and (b), and substituting the
following paragraph:

“(a) Two cents per ton per day or part thereof whether or not

moored to a wharf or to another vessel.”

9. Wharfage rates—The principal regulations are hereby further
amended by revoking Regulation 82 (as substituted by Regulation 10
of the Westport Harbour Regulations 1965, Amendment No. 3), and
substituting the following regulation:

“82. Wharfage at the following rates shall be payable to the
Department in respect of all goods landed on or shipped from any
of the wharves or landing places in the Harbour under the control
of the Department:



1977/132 Westport Harbour Regulations 1965, 587
Amendment No. 5

Description of Goods

$

Minimum charge, per consignment ... .. ... 0.50
On all goods not otherwise specified—

Per tonne .. o e e 1.50

Per cubic metre .. = ... .. .. 1.50
Bulk gravel, per tonne ... = .. . e 0.20
Cement, per tonne ... .. e 1.00
Clinker, per tonne ... .. . SRR 0.50
Coal, per tonne ... = ... e e 1.00
Gypsum, per tonne ... .. e e e 1.10
Logs, per cubic metre ... .. e e 1.00
Motor vehicles (other than motorcycles), set up, each ... 10.00
Motorcycles, each ... ... .. el 4.00
Palings, per 100 ... .. e e 1.20
Posts and sleepers, per 100 ... .. .. .. 1.50
Returns and bona fide empties ... .. .. 0.20
Timber, sawn—

Inwards, per cubic metre ... ... .. .. 1.50

Outwards, per cubic metre ... .. .. 1.00
Vehicles not otherwise specified—

Four-wheeled ... ... . .. .. 10.00

Two-wheeled .. e 4.00”

10. Storage charges—Regulation 83 of the principal regulations (as
substituted by Regulation 11 of the Westport Harbour Regulations
1965, Amendment No. 3) is hereby amended by omitting the expres-
sion “39 cents” and substituting the expression “$1”.

11. Revocations—The following regulations are hereby consequentially
revoked:
(a) Regulations 2, 6, and 10 of the Westport Harbour Regulations
1965, Amendment No. 3:
(b) The Westport Harbour Regulations 1965, Amendment No. 4.

P. G. MILLEN,
Clerk of the Executive Council.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their
general effect.

These regulations increase various fees payable in respect of Westport Harbour.

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936.
Date of notification in Gazette: 26 May 197'_7..
These regulations are administered in the Ministry of Transport.



