
152 

1986/37 

THE TELEGRAPH REGULATIONS 1977, AMENDMENT NO. 6 

PAUL REEVES, Governor·General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At Wellington this 10th day of March 1986 

Present: 

HIS ExCElLENCY THE GoVERNOR· GENERAL IN CoUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Post Office Act 1959, His Excellency the Governor· 
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

1. Tide and commencement 
2. Ordinary telegrams 
3. Urgent telegrams 
4. Letter telegrams 
5. CoUect telegrams 
6. Decorative stationery 
7. Multiple telegrams 
8. Weather telegrams 
9. CanceUation of telegrams 

10. Facsimile service 
11. Press telegrams 

ANALYSIS 

12. Money order telegrams 

13. Carriage charges during the ordinary 
rate period 

14. Delivery fee during the after·hour 
period 

15. Redelivery of telegrams 

16. Reopening of office for press telegrams 

17. Code addresses 

18. Inspection of original telegram 

19. Copy of telegram 

REGULATIONS 

1. Tide and commencement-(1) These regulations may be cited as 
the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 6, and shall be read 



1986/37 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 6 153 

together with and deemed part of the Telegraph Regulations 1977" 
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of April 1986. 

2. Ordinary telegrams-(l) Regulation 3 of the principal regulations (as 
amended by regulation 2 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment 
No. 5) is hereby further amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (2) the expression "l5c", and substituting 
the expression "20c": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (2) the expression "$2.45", and 
substituting the expression "$3.60": 

(c) By omitting from subclause (3) the expression "30c", and substituting 
the expressiol1 "45c": 

(d) By omitting from subclause (3) the expression "$5.00", and 
substituting the expression "$ 7 .50". 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 2. 

8. Urgent telegrams-(l) Regulation 4 of the principal regulations (as 
amended by regulation 3 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment 
No. 5) is hereby further amended by omitting the expression "$1.50", and 
substituting the expression "$2.25". 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 3. 

4. Letter telegrams-(l) Regulation 5 of the principal regulations (as 
amended by regulation 4 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment 
No. 5) is hereby further amended-

(a) By omitting the expression "8c", and substituting the expression 
"12c": 

(b) By omittin!! the expression "$1.25", and substituting the expression 
"$1.85',;. 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 4. 

5. Collect telegrams-(I) Regulation 6 of the principal regulations (as 
amended by regulation 5 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment 
No. 5) is hereby further amended by omitting the expression "35c", and 
substituting the expression "50c". 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 5. 

6. Decorative stationery-(l) Regulation 7 of the principal regulations 
(as amended by regulation 6 ot the Telegraph Regulations 1977, 
Amendment No. 5) is hereby further amended by omitting the expression 
"75c", and substituting the expression "$1.00". 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 6. 

·S.R. 1977/257 
Amendment No. I: S.R. 1919/198 
Amendment No. 2: S.R. 1980/35 
Amendm<nt No. 3: S.R. 1981/306 
Amendment No. 4: S.R. 1982/8 
Amendm<nt No. 5: S.R. 1985/135 



154 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 6 1986/37 

7. Multiple telegrams-(l) Regulation 8 of the principal regulations (as 
amended by regulation 7 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment 
No. 5) is hereby further amended by omitting from paragraph (b) the 
expression "$1.50", and substituting the expression "$2.25". 

(2)The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 7. 

8. Weather telegrams-The principal regulations are hereby amended 
by revoking regulation 9. 

9. Cancellation of telegrams-(l) Regulation 12 of the principal 
regulations (as amended by regulation 9 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, 
Amendment No. 5) is hereby further amended by omitting the expression 
"30c", in both r,laces where it occurs, and substituting in each case the 
expression "45c '. 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 9. 

10. Facsimile service-Regulation 15A (2) of the principal regulations 
(as substituted by regulation 10 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, 
Amendment No. 5) is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "$2.00", and 
substituting the expression "$2.50": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "70c", and substituting 
the expression "85c": 

(c) By omitting from paragra'ph (a) the expression "50c", and substituting 
the expression "60c' : 

(d) By omitting from paragraphs (b) and (c) the expression "$4.00", and 
substituting the expression "$6.00". 

11. Press telegrams-(1) Regulation 16 of the principal regulations (as 
substituted by regulation 11 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, 
Amendment No. 51 is hereby amended by revoking suoclause (I), and 
substituting the following subclause: 

"(1) Inland press telegrams shall be accepted only at a telegraph office 
equipped with a telex gentex connection when in attendance or 
when such telegraph office has been reopened as provided in 
regulation 22 of these regulations:" 

(2) Regulation 16 of the principal regulations (as so substituted) is hereby 
further amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (2) the expression "$2.55", and 
substituting the expression "$3.85": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (3) the expression "$3.30", and 
substituting the expression "$4.95". 

12. Money order telegrams-Regulation 16A of the principal 
regulations (as inserted by regulation 12 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, 
Amendment No. 5) is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting the expression "$ 7 . 50", and substituting the expression 
"$10.00": 

(b) By omitting the expression "$9.00", and substituting the expression 
"$12.25": 

(c) By omitting the figure "15", and substituting the figure "20". 



1986/37 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 6 155 

13. Carriage charges during the ordinary rate period-(I) Regulation 
19 (I) of the principal regulations (as substituted by regulation 15 of the 
Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 and amended by 
regulation 14 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5) is 
hereby further amended by omitting the expression "$1.50", and 
substituting the expression "$2.25". 

(2)The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 14. 

14. Delivery fee during the after·hour period-m Regulation 19A of 
the principal regulations (as substituted by regulation 15 or the Telegraph 
Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 and as amended by regulation 15 of 
the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5) is hereby further 
amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (1) the expression "$4.50", and 
substituting the expression "$6.75"; 

(b) By omitting from subclause (2) the expression "$4.50", and 
substituting the expression "$6.75". 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 15. 

15. Redelivery of telegrams-(1) Regulation 20 of the principal 
regulations (as amended by regulation 16 of the Telegraph Regulations 
1977, Amendment No. 1) is hereby further amended by omitting the 
expression "50c", and substituting the expression "$1.10". 

(2) Regulation 16 of the Telegraph Regulations 197 7, Amendment No. 1 
is hereby consequentially amended by revoking paragraph (b). 

16. Reopening of office for press telegrams-(I) Regulation 22 of the 
principal regulations (as amended by regulation 16 of the Telegraph 
Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5) is hereby further amended by 
omitting the expression "$30", and substituting the expression "$45". 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 16. 

17. Code addresses-(l} Regulation 24 of the principal regulations (as 
amended by regulation 17 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment 
No. 5) is hereby further amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (1) the expression "40", and substituting 
the expression "45"; 

(b) By omitting from subclause (1) the expression "10", and substituting 
the expression "11.25". 

(2) Regulation 17 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 
are hereby consequentially amended by revoking paragraphs (a) and (b) of 
subclause (1). 

18. Inspection of original telegram-(1) Regulation 26 of the principal 
regulations (as amended by regulation 18 of the Telegraph Regulations 
1977, Amendment No. 5) is hereby further amended-



156 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 6 1986/37 

(a) By omittin~ from paragraph (a) of subclause (2) the expression 
"$1.50' , and substituting the expression "$2.25": 

(b) By omittin~ from paragraphs (b) and (c) of subclause (2) the expression 
"$3.00 " and substituting in each case the expression "$4.50". 

(2) The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 18. 

19. Copy of telegram-m Regulation 27 (1) of the principal regulations 
(as amended by regulation 19 of the Telegraph Regulations 1977, 
Amendment No. 5) is hereby further amended by omitting the expression 
"$1.50", and substituting the expression "$2.25' . 

(2)The Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 5 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 19. 

P. C. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 
These regulations set out a new scale of charges for telegraph services coming into force on 

1 April 1986. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 13 March 1986. 
These regulations are administered in the Post Office. 


