
1023 

ID7D/ID8 

THE TELEGRAPH REGULATIONS 1977, AMENDMENT NO. 1 

KEITH HOL YOAKE, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington this 17th day of September 1979 

Present: 

HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Post Office Act 1959, His Excellency the Governor­
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

1. Title and commencement 
2. Ordinary telegrams 
3. Urgent telegrams 
4. Letter telegrams 
5. Collect telegrams 
6. Decorative stationary 
7. Multiple telegrams 
8. \,y eather telegrams 
9. Cancellation of telegrams 

10. Phototelegrams 

ANALYSIS 

IS. New regulations relating to carriage 
charges substituted 

19. Carriage charges during the 
ordinary rate period 

19 .... Delivery fee during the after­
hour period 

16. Redelivery of telegrams 
17. Reopening of office for ordinary 

telegrams 

11. Phototelegrams addressed to 2 or more 
18. Reopening of office for press telegrams 
19. Code addresses 

addresses 
12. Additional copies 
13. Press telegrams 
14. Transferred charge telegrams 

20. Inspection of original telegram 
21. Copy of telegram 
22. Rental for lease of telegraph apparatus 

Schedule 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and cOlDlDencelDent-(l) These regulations may be cited 
as the Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1, and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Telegraph Regulations 1977* 
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of October 
1979. 

·S.R. 1977/257 



1024 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 1979/198 

2. Ordinary telegrams-Regulation 3 of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from sub clause (2) the expression "4c", and sub­
stituting the expression "6c": 

(b) By omitting from sub clause (2) the expression "50c", and sub­
stituting the expression "$1": 

(c) By omitting from subclause (3) the expression "8c", and sub­
stituting the expression "12c": 

(d) By omitting from sub clause (3) the expression "$1", and sub­
stituting the expression "$2". 

3. Urgent telegrams-Regulation 4 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by omitting the expression "35c", and substituting 
the expression "60c". 

4. Letter telegrams-Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended-

(a) By omitting the expression "2c", and substituting the expression 
"3c": 

Cb) By omitting the expression "25c", and substituting the expression 
"50c". 

5. Collect telegrams-Regulation 6 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by omitting the expression "20c", and substituting the 
expression "25c". 

6. Decorative stationery-Regulation 7 of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting the expression "15c", and substituting 
the expression "30c". 

7. Multiple telegrams-Regulation 8 of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting from paragraph (b) the expression 
"50c", and substituting the expression "85c". 

8. Weather telegrams-Regulation 9 of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from sub clause (1) the figure "25", and substituting 
the figure "45": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (1) the figure "50", and substituting 
the figure "90": 

(c) By omitting from sub clause (2) the expression "2c", and sub­
stituting the expression "3c": 

(d) By omitting from sub clause (2) the expression "4c", and sub­
stituting the expression "6c". 

9. Cancellation of telegrams-Regulation 12 of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression" lOc", in both 
places where it occurs, and substituting in each case the expression 
"17c". 



1979/198 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 1025 

10. PhototelegraDls-Regulation 13 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (1) the expression "$12", and sub­
stituting the expression "$20": 

(b) By omitting from sub clause (2) the expression "$9.60", and 
substituting the expression "$16". 

11. PhototelegraDls addressed to 2 or Dlore addresses-Regu­
lation 14 of the principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting 
from paragraph (b) the expression "$2.40", and substituting the 
expression "$5". 

12. Additional copies-Regulation 15 of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$1.20", and substituting 
the expression "$2.50". 

13. Press telegraDls-Regulation 16 (1) of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "60c", and 
substituting the expression "$1": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (b) the expression "75c", and 
substituting the expression "$1.30". 

14. Transferred charge telegraDls-Regulation 18 of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended by omitting from subclause (3) the 
expression "20c", and substituting the expression "25c". 

15. New regulations relating to carriage charges substituted­
The principal regulations are hereby amended by revoking regulation 19, 
and substituting the following regulations: 

"19. Carriage charges during the ordinary rate period­
(1) For the delivery of telegrams beyond the telegram delivery area, but 
within 5 kilometres of the office of destination when that office is open, 
the carriage charges shall be 60c a kilometre or part thereof for the 
distance beyond the telegram delivery area. 

"(2) For the delivery of telegrams beyond 5 kilometres of the office 
of destination when that office is open, the carriage charges payable 
shall equal the charges incurred in effecting delivery by special messenger. 

"19A. Delivery fee during the after-hour period-Cl) For the 
delivery during the after-hour period within the delivery area of the 
office of destination of a telegram or an advice that a telegram is held 
at a Post Office, a fee of $2 shall apply if a telephone address cannot be 
established at the time of lodgment. 

"(2) For the delivery during the after-hour period beyond the 
delivery area of the office of destination of a telegram or an advice 
that a telegram is held at a Post Office, actual delivery costs with a 
minimum of $2 shall apply if a telephone address cannot be established 
at the time of lodgment. 

"(3) This regulation shall not apply to telegrams with respect to offices 
open on Saturdays until after 11.30 a.m. that day, and regulation 19 
of these regulations shall apply instead thereof." 



1026 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 1979/198 

16. Redelivery of telegralDs-Regulation 20 (a) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting the word "free": 
(b) By omitting the expression "30c", and substituting the expression 

"50c". 

17. Reopening of office for ordinary telegralDs-Regulation 21 
of the principal regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) (i) the expression "15c", and 
substituting the expression "30c": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (a) (ii) the expression "35c", and 
substituting the expression "60c": 

(c) By omitting from paragraph (b) (i) the expression "50c", and 
substituting the expression "85c": 

(d) By omitting from paragraph (b) (ii) the expression "$1", and 
substituting the expression "$1. 70": 

(e) By omitting from paragraph (b) (ii) the expression "50c", and 
substituting the expression "85c". 

18. Reopening of office for press telegralDs-Regulation 22 of 
the principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression 
"$7", and substituting the expression "$12". 

19. Code addresses-Regulation 24 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (1) the figure "18", and substituting 
the figure "30": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (1) the figure "4.50", and substituting 
the figure "7.50": 

(c) By omitting from sub clause (2) the figure "0.15", and substituting 
the figure "0.30": 

(d) By omitting from sub clause (2) the figure "0.35", and sub­
stituting the figure "0.60". 

20. Inspection of original telegralD-Regulation 26 of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) of sub clause (2) the figure 
"0.60", and substituting the figure "1.00". 

(b) By omitting from paragraphs (b) and (c) of subclause (2) the 
figure "1.20", and substituting in each case the figure "2.00". 

21. Copy oftelegralD-Regulation 27 (1) of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting the expression "50c", and substituting 
the expression "85c". 

22. Rental for lease of telegraph apparatus-The principal 
regulations are hereby amended by revoking the First Schedule, and 
substituting the new First Schedule set out in the Schedule attached to 
these regulations. 



1979/198 Telegraph Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 

SCHEDULE 

"NEW FIRST SCHEDULE TO PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS 

CHARGES 

1027 

2-monthly Weekly Charge 
Item Charge (Temporary 

Lease) 
$ $ 

Teleprinter (50 baud) 125 22 
Teleprinter (75 baud) 150 26 
Teleprinter (100 baud) 175 32 
Teleprinter-receive only (50 baud) 90 15 
Teleprinter-receive only (75 baud) 105 18 
Reperforator attachment (50 baud) 35 6 
Reperforator attachment (75 baud) 42 8 
Reperforator attachment (100 baud) 49 9 
Tape transmitter/reader (50 baud) 45 8 
Tape transmitter/reader (75 baud) 52 9 
Tape transmitter/reader (100 baud) 60 10 
Printing reperforator (50 baud) 150 
Printing reperforator (75 baud) 180 
Combined printing reperforator and transmitter (50 

baud) 180 
Combined printing reperforator and transmitter (75 

baud) 218 
Off-line tape punching unit 160 29 
Code recognition unit 45 
Silencing cover for M75 teleprinter 10 
Tape winder 10 
Automatic page winder 10 
Switching facilities (each pair of circuits) 10 
Data modems: 

Type 200A 31 6 
600A 48 9 
600B 48 9 
600C 48 9 
600D 48 9 
600C/D 60 10 
600E/2 48 9 
600E/4 48 9 

Data telephone (leased circuit) 10 2 

Installation charge 40 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 
This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general e.ffect. 
These regulations come into force on 1 October 1979 as set out in a new scale of charges 

for the telegraph services. 
Regulation 15 provides for a fee to be charged for the delivery of telegrams during the 

after-hours period. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 20 September 1979. 
These regulations are administered in the Post Office. 


