
1045 

1979/200 

THE TELEX REGULATIONS 1977, AMENDMENT NO. 1 

KEITH HOLYOAKE, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington this 17th day of September 1979 

Present: 

HIs EXCELLENCY THE GoVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Post Office Act 1959, His Excellency the Governor­
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

1. Title and commencement 
2. Service connection fee 
3. Call charges 

ANALYSIS 

7. Telex messages for delivery by the 
Post Office (Teltex) 

4. Discontinuance of service of defaulting 
subscriber 

8. Messages lodged by telephone for telex 
delivery by the Post Office 
(Phonatelex) 

9. Removals 
5. Additional directory listings 10. Change of teleprinter 
6. Public telex booths 11. Change of answer-back code 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and commencement-Cl) These regulations may be cited 
as the Telex Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1, and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Telex Regulations 1977* (herein­
after referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of October 
1979. 

2. Service connection fee-Regulation 13 of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$100", and substituting 
the expression "$133". 

·S.R. 1977/259 



1046 Telex Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 1979/200 

3. Call charges-Regulation 17 (1) of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by omitting the words "7.5 cents for each 8 seconds' 
duration", and substituting the words "5.625 cents for each 6 seconds' 
duration". 

4. Discontinuance of service of defaulting subscriber-Regu­
lation 20 (4) of the principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting 
the expression "$15", and substituting the expression "$20". 

5. Additional directory listings-Regulation 23 (1) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "$1", and sub­
stituting the expression "$1.20": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (b) the expression "63 cents", and 
substituting the expression "75 cents". 

6. Public telex booths-Regulation 35 of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (2) (b) the expression "60 cents", and 
substituting the expression "$1": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (3) the expression "20 cents", and 
substituting the expression "25 cents". 

7. Telex IDes sages for delivery by the Post Office (Teltex)­
Regulation 36 of the principal regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from sub clause (2) (b) the expression "90 cents", 
and substituting the expression "$1.60": 

(b) By omitting from sub clause (3) (a) the expression "20c", and 
substituting the expression "25c": 

(c) By omitting from subclause (3) (b) the expression "35c", and 
substituting the expression "60c". 

8. Messages lodged by telephone for telex delivery by the Post 
Office (Phonatelex)-Regulation 37 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from sub clause (3) (b) the expression "$1.50", and 
substituting the expression "$2.50": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (3) (b) the expression "50 cents", 
and substituting the expression "85 cents": 

Cc) By omitting from subclause (4) the expression "20 cents", and 
substituting the expression "25 cents". 

9. RelDovals-Regulation 38 of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended-

(a) By omitting from sub clause (1) (a) the figure "lOO", and sub­
stituting the figure "133": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (1) (a) the figure "20", and sub­
stituting the figure "27": 

(c) By omitting from subclause (1) (b) the figure "60", and sub­
stituting the figure "80". 

10. Change of teleprinter-Regulation 39 (2) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$100", and 
substituting the expression "$133'~. 



1979/200 Telex Regulations 1977, Amendment No. 1 1047 

11. Change of answer-back code-Regulation 40 of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$20", and 
substituting the expression "$27". 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 
These regulations increase certain charges for the telex service with effect from 

1 October 1979. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 20 September 1979. 
These regulations are administered in the Post Office. 

Con. ....Ita 


