
1366 

1977/301 

THE TERTIARY BURSARIES REGULATIONS 1976, 
AMENDMENT NO. 1 

KEITH HOLYOAKE, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington this 28th day of November 1977 

Present: 

HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Education Act 1964, His Excellency the Governor­
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

ANALYSIS 

1. Title and commencement 
2. Exercise of Director-General's 

powers by Councils of tertiary 
insti tu tions, etc. 

3. Restrictions on employment 
4. Value of tertiary bursary 
5. Abatement of tertiary bursary 
6. Married students 

7. Extension of usual term of tertiary 
bursary 

8. Reinstatement of tertiary bursary 
9. Academic qualifications for tertiary 

bursary 
10. Tertiary bursary awarded or ex· 

tended for masters study 
11. Payment of additional tuition fees 
12. Extension of benefits of fees bursary 
13. Award of tertiary bursary to 

teachers college students 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and commencement- ( 1) These regulations may be cited as 
the Tertiary Bursaries Regulations 1976, Amendment No. 1, and shall 
be read together with and deemed part of the Tertiary Bursaries 
Regulations 1976* (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) Regulations 1, 3, 8, 9, and 11 of these regulations shall come into 
force on the day after the date of the notification of these regulations 
in the Gazette. 

(3) Subject to subclause (2) of this regulation, these regulations shall 
rome into force on the 1st day of February 1978. 

*S.R. 1976/276 



1977/301 Tertiary Bursaries Regulations 1976, 
Amendment No. 1 

1367 

2. Exercise of Director-General's powers by Councils of tertiary 
institutions, etc.-Regulation 4 (6) of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended-

(a) By inserting, after the expression "17 (2)", the expression 
"17 (5)": 

(b) By inserting, after the expression "32 (5)", the expression 
"32 (7)". 

3. Restrictions on employment-( 1) The ptmcipal regulations are 
hereby further amended by revoking regulation 8. 

(2) Regulation 23 (1) of the principal regulations is hereby con­
sequentially amended by omitting the expression "regulations 8 and 10", 
and substituting the expression "regulation 10". 

4. Value of tertiary bursary- ( 1) Regulation 12 ( 1 ) (a) of the 
principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression 
"$24", and substituting the expression "$26". 

(2) Regulation 12 (1) (b) of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by omitting the expression "$27", and substituting the 
expression "$29". 

(3) The said regulation 12 is hereby further amended by revoking 
subclause (2), and substituting the following subclause: 

"(2) A bursary shall be payable in any year in respect of a recognised 
course of study for a period commencing with the beginning of the 
week when in the opinion of the Director-General, the course com­
mences, and ending at the end of the week during which, in the opinion 
of the Director-General, the course ends: 

Provided that where examinations in respect of that course commence 
within 6 weeks of the end of that period, the bursary shall continue to 
be paid until the end of the week in which the last such examination 
is held." 

5. Abatement of tertiary bursary-Regulation 13 (1) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expressions "$13" and 
"$16", and substituting, respectively, the expressions "$15" and "$18". 

6. Married students-Regulation 14 (3) of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$48", and substituting 
the expression "$50". 

7. Extension of usual tenn of tertiary bursary-( 1) Regulation 17 of 
the principal regulations is hereby amended by revoking subclause (3), 
and substituting the following subclause: 

" (3) If a bursar has completed one recognised course of study and 
has enrolled for a second recognised course of study, the Director­
General may extend the payment of the tertiary bursary for such a 
period as is, in his opinion, the minimum period required for the 
completion of the second course: 

Provided that in the case of a bursar enrolled at a university, the 
Director-General may, on the recommendation of the Professorial Board, 



l368 Tertiary Bursaries Regulations 1976, 
Amendment No. 1 

1977 /301 

extend the payment of the tertiary bursary in respect of the second 
course during the final year of the recognised course of study first 
undertaken by the bursar. 

(2) The said regulation 17 is hereby further amended by revoking 
subclauses (7), (8), (11), (12), and (13). 

8. Reinstatement of tertiary bursary-Regulation 21 of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting the words ", in a subsequent year of study", and 
substituting the word "subsequently"; and 

(b) By revoking the proviso. 

9. Academic qualifications for tertiary bursary- (1) Regulation 
30 (a) of the principal regulations is hereby amended by revoking 
subparagraph (iv), and substituting the following subparagraph: 

"(iv) Enrolled for the first time in a recognised course at a 
tertiary institution after a period of 2 years or more since 
qualifying academically for entrance to a university as afore­
said; or". 

(2) The said regulation 30 (a) is hereby amended by adding the 
following subparagraph: 

"( vi) Enrolled for the first time in a recognised course at a 
tertiary institution after a period of 3 years or more since 
leaving school during which period he has qualified for 
entrance to a university: 

"Provided that, for the purposes of this subparagraph, 
attendance at a secondary school pursuant to section 93 (5) 
of the Education Act 1964 shall be deemed to take place after 
the person so attending has left school." 

(3) Regulation 30 (b) of the principal regulations is hereby amended 
by omitting the words "in any year, whether before or after the 
commencement of these regulations, but before the year in which the 
bursary is awarded", and substituting the words ", whether before or 
after the commencement of these regulations,". 

(4) Regulation 30 (c) of the principal regulations is hereby amended 
by omitting the words "but before the year in which the bursary is 
awarded". 

10. Tertiary bursary awarded or extended for masters study­
(1) Regulation 32 (1) of the principal regulations is hereby amended 
by revoking paragraph (b). 

(2) Regulation 32 (2) of the principal regulations is hereby amended 
by omitting the words "or from proceeding within the prescribed time 
to the course of study leading to a masters degree". 

(3) The said regulation 32 is hereby further amended by adding the 
following subclause: 

"( 7) Notwithstanding regulation 7 of these regulations, if the 
Director-General is satisfied that work required to be carried out by a 
bursar as part of a course of study leading to a masters degree cannot 



1977/301 Tertiary Bursaries Regulations 1 !:J76, 
Amendment No. 1 

1369 

adequately be carried out in New Zealand, he may approve the payment 
of a tertiary bursary to that bursar for a period not exceeding one year 
while the bursar carries out that work outside New Zealand." 

11. Payment of additional tuition fees-Regulation 35 (1) of the 
principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting the words 
"of study". 

12. Extension of benefits of fees bursary-Regulation 37 (2) of the 
principal regulations is hereby amended by revoking paragraph (a). 

13. Award of tertiary bursary to teachers college students-The 
principal regulations are hereby further amended by revoking regula­
tion 41, and substituting the following regulation: 

"41. The Director-General may award a tertiary bursary to a full-time 
student who is enrolled at a teachers college in a recognised course of 
study (other than a one year woodwork, metalwork, engineering, 
commercial, Maori language, or music course) that he commenced in 
or after 1976 and who is not enrolled in a Division C course, a Division 
AG course, or a Division B course that has been reduced to one year." 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their 
general effect. 

These regulations give effect to various changes in the award of the standard 
tertiary bursary announced in the Budget. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 1 December 1977. 
These regulations are administered in the Department of Education. 


