
50 

1882/10 

THE TELEX AND DATEX REGULATIONS 1981, 
AMENDMENT NO. 1 

DA VID BEA TTIE, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington this 26th day of January 1982 

Present: 

HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

Pl:RSUANT to the Post Office Act 1959, His Excellency the Governor­
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Tide and commencement-(l) These regulations may be cited as 
the Telex and Datex ~gulations 1981, Amendment No. 1, and shall be 
read together with and deemed part of the Telex and Datex Regulations 
1981* (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) Subject to sub clause (3) of this regulation, these regulations shall 
come into force on the 1st day of February 1982. 

(3) Regulations 2, 4, 5, and 7 of these regulations shall come into force 
on the 1st day of April 1982. 

2. Joint use of telex installation-Regulation 11 (3) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting the expression "$6.25", and substituting the expression 
"$10": 

(b) By omitting the expression "$5", and substituting the expression 
"$8" . 

's.R. 1981/307 



1982/10 Telex and Datex Regulations 1981, 
Amendment No. 1 

51 

3. Service connection fee-(1) Regulation 14 (1) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "$133", and 
substituting the expression "$175": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (b) the expression "$133", and 
substituting the expression "$175": 

(c) By omitting from paragraph (c) the expression "$65", and 
substituting the expression "$115". 

(2) Regulation 14 (1) of the principal regulations is hereby further 
amended by adding the following paragraph: 

"(d) If the telex installation or datex installation, internal wiring, and 
outside circuit are in position from a former connection, and 
the installation is taken over without alteration except to the 
telex number and answer-back code, the charge shall be 
reduced to $33." 

4. Rental-Regulation 15 of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by revoking paragraph (a), and substituting the following 
paragraph: 

"(a) Telex Service: 
Each Month 

"(i) For non-tape installation 
"(ii) For non-tape installation and computer 

interface unit 
"(iii) For installation with tape facilities 
"(iv) For installation with tape facilities and 

computer interface unit 
"(v) For non-tape installation with electronic 

memory 
"(vi) For installation with tape facilities and 

electronic memory 
"(vii) For non-tape installation with electronic 

memory and VDU 
"(viii) Supplementary memory for non-tape 

installation with electronic memory 
"Provided that where, in special circumstances 

approved by the Director-General, a telex installa­
tion does not include a teleprinter, the charges for 
the installation shall be $78.00 per month:". 

$ 
112.50 

127.50 
150.00 

165.00 

170.00 

200.00 

260.00 

7.50 

5. Outer area charges-Regulation 16 (2) of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the words "Forty-three cents", and 
substituting the words "Sixty cents": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (b) the words "Twenty-one cents", 
and substituting the words "Thirty cents". 

6. Discontinuance of service of defaulting subscribers-Regu­
lation 22 (4) of the principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting 
the expression "$20", and substituting the expression "$25". 



52 Telex and Datex Regulations 1981, 
Amendment No. 1 

1982/10 

7. Additional directory listings-Regulation 25 (I) of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "$1", and 
substituting the expression "$1.50": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (b) the expression "63 cents", and 
substituting the expression "$1". 

8. Public telex booths-Regulation 38 (3) of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting the expression "25 cents", and 
substituting the expression "30 cents". 

9. Telex messages for delivery by Post Office (Teltex)­
Regulation 39 of the principal regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from subclause (2) (b) the expression "$1.60", and 
substituting the expression "$2.70": 

(b) By omitting from subclause (3) (a) the expression "25c", and 
substituting the expression "30c": 

(c) By omitting from subclause (3) (b) the expression "60c", and 
substituting the expression "$1". 

10. Messages lodged by telephone for telex delivery by Post 
Office (Phonatelex)-Regulation 40 (4) of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by omitting the expression "25 cents", and substituting 
the expression "30 cents". 

11. Removals-Regulation 43 (l) of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "133", and 
substituting the expression "175": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "27", and 
substituting the expression "33": 

(c) By omitting from paragraph (b) the expression "80", and 
substituting the expression "105". 

12. Change of answer-back code--Regulation 45 of the principal 
regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$27", and 
substituting the expression "$33". 

13. Connection of telex/computer interface--Regulation 46 of the 
principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression 
"$27", and substituting the expression "$33". 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulatioTlS, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 

These regulations increase certain charges for the telex and datex services with effect from 
1 February 1982, and certain other telex and datex charges with effect from 1 April 1982. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Ga<.ette: 28 January 1982. 
These regulations are administered in the Post Office. 


