
20011300 

Status of Children (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2001 

Silvia Cartwright, Governor-General 

Order in Council 

At Wellington this 1st day of October 2001 

Present: 
The Right Hon Helen Clark presiding in Council 

Pursuant to section II (1 )(a) of the Status of Children Act 1969, Her 
Excellency the Governor-General, acting on the advice and with the 
consent of the Executive Council, makes the following regulations. 

I 
2 

Title 
Commencement 

1 Title 

Contents 

Fees prescribed 

Regulations 

(1) These regulations are the Status of Children (Fees) Amend­
ment Regulations 200 I. 

(2) In these regulations, the Status of Children (Fees) Regulations 
1995' are called "the principal regulations". 
I SR 1995/187 

2 Commencement 
These regulations come into force on 3 October 2001. 

2423 



.. 3 
Status of Children (Fees) Amendment 

Regulations 2001 

3 Fees prescribed 

2001/300 

(1) Regulation 3(1 )(a) of the principal regulations is amended by 
omitting the expression "$20", and substituting the expres­
sion "$35". 

(2) Regulation 3(1 )(b) of the principal regulations is amended by 
omitting the expression "$20", and substituting the expres­
sion "$35". 

Marie Shroff, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

Explanatory note 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate 
their general effect. 

These regulations, which come into force on 3 October 200 I, amend 
the fees payable for search and certification services under the Status 
of Children (Fees) Regulations 1995. 

Issued under the authority of the Acts and Regulations Publication Act 1989. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 2 October 2001. 
These regulations are administered in the Department of Internal Affairs. 

2424 


