
1232 

1994/208 

THE RESOURCE MANAGEMENT (TRANSITIONAL, FEES, RENTS, 
AND R.OYALTIES) REGULATIONS 1991, AMENDMENT NO. 4 

CATHERINE A. TIZARD, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At Wellington this 26th day of September 1994 

Present: 

HER ExCElLENCY THE GoVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Resource Management Act 1991, Her Excellency': the 
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

ANALYSIS 

I. Title and commencement 4. Geothermal royalties 
2. Payment of rents and royalties for 

existing licences, leases, permits, etc. 
3. Remission of rentals for existing 

licences 

5. Expiry 
6. Fees 
7. Revocation 
8. Expiry 

REGULATIONS 
1. Tide and commencement-(1) These regulations may be cited as 

the Resource Management (TransitIOnal, Fees, Rents, and Royalties) 
Regulations 1991, Amendment No_ 4, and shall be read together With and 
deemed part of the Resource Mana&ement (Transitional, Fees, Rents, and 
Royalties) Regulations 1991" (heremafter referred to as the principal 
regulations). 

·S.R. 1991/206 
Amendment No. I: S.R. 1992/158 
Amendment No. 2: S.R. 1995/192 
Amendment No. S: S.R. 1994/198 



1994/208 Resource Management (Transitional, Fees, Rents, and 
Royalties) Regulations 1991, Amendment No. 4 

1233 

(2) Except as provided in regulation 6 (2) of these regulations, these 
regulations shall come into force on the 30th day of September 1994. 

2. Payntent of rents and royalties for existing licences, leases, 
permits, etc.-(I) Regulation 7 (1) of the principal regulations (as 
amended by regulation 2 of the Resource Management (Transitional, Fees, 
Rents, and Royalties) Regulations 1991, Amendment No. 2) is hereby 
amended by omitting the expression "September 1994", and substituting 
the expression "September 1996". 

(2) Regulation 7 (2) of the principal regulations (as amended by 
regulation 2 of the Resource Management (Transitional, Fees, Rents, and 
Royalties) Regulations 1991, Amendment No. 2) is hereby amended by 
omitting the expression "30th day of September 1994", and substituting 
the expression "30th day of September 1996". 

(3) Regulation 2 of the Resource Management (Transitional, Fees, Rents, 
and Royalties) Regulations 1991, Amendment No. 2 is hereby 
consequentially revoked. 

S. Remission of rentals for existing licences-Regulation 13 (3) of 
the principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression 
"30th day of September 1994", and substituting the expression "30th day 
of September 1996". 

4. Geothermal royalties-Regulation 14 (1) of the principal regulations 
is hereby amended by omitting the expression "30th day of September 
1994", and substituting the expression '30th day of September 1996". 

5. Expiry-( 1) Regulation 20 of the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by omitting the expression "September 1994", and substituting 
the expression "September 1996". 

(2) Regulation 4 of the Resource Management (Transitional, Fees, Rents, 
and Royalties) Regulations 1991, Amendment No. 2 is hereby 
consequentially amended by omitting the expression "September 1994", 
and substituting the expression "September 1996". 

6. Fees-( 1 ) The First Schedule to the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by omitting from the 3rd column of the item relating to an 
application for a water conservation order the expression "$250", and 
substituting the expression "$1,000". 

(2) This regulation shall come into force on the 6th day of October 1994. 

7. Revocation-The Resource Management (Transitional, Fees, Rents, 
and Royalties) Regulations 1991, Amendment No. 3 are hereby revoked. 

8. Expiry-These regulations shall expire with the close of the 30th day 
of September 1996. 

MARIE SHROFF, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 



1234 Resource Management (Transitional, Fees, Rents, and 
Royalties) Regulations 1991, Amendment No. 4 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part oj the regulations. but is intended to indicate their general effect. 

1994/208 

These regulations. which com .. into force on 30 September 1994 and expire with the close 
of 30 September 1996, extend the period provided for the payment of certain rents and 
royalties for existing licences, leases, and permits in the coastal marine area, and in respect of 
geothermal rentals and royalties, at the existing rate until the close of 30 September 1996. 

The fee for an application for a water conservation order is increased, on 6 October 1994, 
from $250 to $1,000. 

Issued under the authority of the Acts and Regulations Publication Act 1989. 
Date of notification in Gautte: 29 September 1994. 
These regulations are administered in the Ministry for the Environment. 


