369
1986/91

THE PHARMACY REGISTRATION REGULATIONS 1972,
AMENDMENT NO. 4

PAUL REEVES, Governor-General

ORDER IN COUNCIL
At Wellington this 19th day of May 1986
Present:

His EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL

PURSUANT to section 57 of the Pharmacy Act 1970, His Excellency the
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations.

REGULATIONS

1. Title and commencement—(1) These regulations may be cited as
the Pharmacy Registration Regulations 1972, Amendment No. 4, and shall
be read together with and deemed J)art of the Pharmacy Registration
Regulations 1972*% (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations).

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of June 1986.

2. Pharmacy registration fees—Regulation 7 of the principal
regulations (as amended by regulation 2 (1) of the Pharmacy Registration
Regulations 1972, Amendment No. 3) is hereby amended by omitting the
expression “$75” in both places where it occurs, and substituting in each
case the expression “$150”.

*S.R. 1972/94
Amendment No. 1: (Revoked by S.R. 1980/72)

Amendment No, 2: (Revoked by SR. 1982/113)
Amendment No. 3: S.R. 1982/118



370 Pharmacy Registration Regulations 1972, 1986/91
Amendment No. 4

3. Penalties for offences—Regulation 15 of the principal regulations is
hereby amended by omitting the expression “$20”, and substituting the
expression “$150”.

4. Revocation—The Pharmacy Registration Regulations 1972,
Amendment No. 3 are hereby revoked.

P. G. MILLEN,
Clerk of the Executive Council.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect.

These regulations, which come into force on 1 June 1986,—

(a) Increase from $75 to $150 the annual registration fee for a pharmacy; and

(b) Increase from $20 to $150 the maximum fine that may be imposed for an offence against
the principal regulations.

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936.
Date of notification in Gazette: 22 May 1986.
These regulations are administered in the Department of Health.



