92

1977/15

0
"\” R
P, e

Ko Sy

THE MUSIC TEACHERS REGISTRATION REGULATIONS 1966,
AMENDMENT NO. 2

DENIS BLUNDELL, Governor-General
ORDER IN COUNCIL

At the Government Buildings at Wellington this 14th day of February
1977

Present:
TueE Ricar Hon. R. D. MuLpoON PRESIDING IN COUNCIL
PursuAaNT to the Music Teachers Registration Act 1928, His Excellency

the Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations.

REGULATIONS

1. Title and commencement— (1) These regulations may be cited as
the Music Teachers Registration Regulations 1966, Amendment No. 2,
and shall be read together with and deemed part of the Music Teachers
Registration Regulations 1966* (hereinafter referred to as the principal
regulations).

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of March
1977.

2. Annual registration fee— (1) Regulation 15 of the principal regula-
tions (as amended by regulation 2 of the Music Teachers Registration
Regulations 1966, Amendment No. 1) is hereby amended by omitting
the expression “$2.10”, and substituting the expression “$10”.

(2) The Music Teachers Registration Regulations 1966, Amendment
No. 1 are hereby consequentially revoked.

3. Application fee—Paragraph F of the form numbered 1 in the First
Schedule to the principal regulations (as amended by section 7 of the
Decimal Currency Act 1964) is hereby amended by omitting the
expression “$1.50”, and substituting the expression “$10”.

P. G. MILLEN,

Clerk of the Executive Council.

*S.R. 1966/58
Amendment No. 1: S.R. 1972/232



1977/15  Music Teachers Registration Regulations 1966, 93
Amendment No. 2

EXPLANATORY NOTE

ﬁThis note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general
effect.
These amendments amend the Music Teachers Registration Regulations 1966.
Regulation 1 relates to the Title and commencement. The regulations come
into force on 1 March 1977. : :
Regulation 2 increases the annual registration fee from $2.10 to $10.
Regulation 3 increases the fee payable on application for registration from

$1.50 to $10.

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936.
Date of notification in Gazette: 17 February 1977.
These regulations are administered in the Department of Education.



