
1624 

1970/247 

THE MOTOR SPIRITS DISTRIBUTION REGULATIONS 1955, 
AMENDMENT NO. 3 

ARTHUR PORRITT, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington this 7th day of December 1970 

Present: 
HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Motor Spirits DistI1ibution Act 1953, His Excellency 
the Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of 
the Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and commencement-( 1) These regulations may be cited as 
the Motor Spirits Distribution Regulations 1955, Amendment No. 3, 
and shall be read together with and deemed part of the Motor Spirits 
Distribution Regulations 1955* (hereinafter referred to as the principal 
regulations) . 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of 
April 1971. 

2. Wholesaler's annual licence fee-( 1) Regulation 10 of the principal 
regulations (as amended by regulation 2 of the Motor Spirits Distribu
tion Regulations 1955, Amendment No. 2) is hereby further amended 
by omitting the expression "$6", and substituting the expression "$72". 

(2) Regulation 2 of the Motor Spirits Distribution Regulations 1955, 
Amendment No. 2, is hereby revoked. 

3. Application fee for retailer's licence-Regulation 15 of the principal 
regulations (as amended by section 7 (1) of the Decimal Currency Act 
1964) is hereby further amended by omitting the expression "$4", and 
substituting the expression "$10". 

P. J. BROOKS, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

*S.R. 1955(51 
Amendment No. I: S.R. 19SR(24 
Amendment No. 2: S.R. 1967(288 



1970/247 Motor Spirits Distribution Regulations 1955, 
Amendment No. 3 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

1625 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general 
effect. 

These regulations increase the annual fee for a wholesaler's 1icence from 
$6 to $72, and increase the fee for an application for a retailer's licence, and 
for a transfer or variation of a retailer's licence, from $4 to $10. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 10 December 1970. 
These regulations are administered in the Department of Industries and 

Commerce. 


