
537 

1989/148 

THE MINING REGULATIONS 1981, AMENDMENT NO. 4, 

PAUL REEVES, Governor·General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At Wellington this 29th day of May 1989 

Present: 

THE RIGlIT HON. G. W. R. PALMER PRESIDING IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Mining Act 1971, His Excellency the Governor·General, 
acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, hereby 
makes the following regulations. 

REGULA nONS 
1. Tide and commencement-(I) These regulations may be cited as 

the Mining Regulations 1981, Amendment No. 4, and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Mining Regulations 1981" 
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of July 1989. 

2. Fees and rent inclusive of goods and services tax-The principal 
regulations are hereby amended by revoking regulation 4A (as inserted by 
regulation 2 of the Mining Regulations, Amendment No. 3), and 
SUbstituting the following regulation: 

"4A. The fees and rent prescribed by these regulations are inclusive of 
goods and services tax at the rate of 12.5 percent payable under the Goods 
and Services Tax Act 1985." 

·S.R. 1981/347 
Amendment No. I: S.R. 1985/199 
Amendment No. 2: (RrooAed fry S.R. 1988/329) 
Amendment No. 3: S.R. 1988/329 



538 Mining Regulations 1981, Amendment No. 4 1989/143 

S. Rent payable under prospecting licence-( 1) The principal 
regulations are hereby amended by revoking regulation 8 (as substituted 
by regulation 3 of the Mining Regulations 1981, Amendment No. 3), and 
substituting the following regulation: 

"8. (1) The annual rent payable under a prospecting licence shall be
"(a) For the initial term of the licence, $2.25 per hectare or part of a 

hectare or $45, whichever is the greater: 
"(b) On renewal of the licence, $4.50 per hectare or part of a hectare or 

$90, whichever is the greater. 
"(2) The rent shall be paid yearly in advance." 

4. Rent payable under mining licences-The principal regulations 
are hereby amended by revoking regulation 12 (as substituted by 
regulation 4 of the Mining Regulations 1981, Amendment No. 3), and 
sUbstituting the following regulation: 

"12. The annual rent payable under a mining licence shall be $11.25 per 
hectare or part of a hectare." 

5. Rent payable under special-site licences-Regulation 13 of the 
principal regulations (as amended by regulation 5 of the Mining 
Regulations 1981, Amendment No. 3) is hereby amended by omitting the 
expression "$110", and substituting the expression "$112.50". 

6. Rent payable under other licences-Regulation 14 of the principal 
regulations (as amended by regulation 6 of the Mining Regulations 1981, 
Amendment No. 3) is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$110", 
and substituting the expression "$112.50". 

7. New Second Schedule substituted-The principal regulations are 
hereby amended by revoking the Second Schedule (as sUbstituted by 
regulation 8 of the Mining Regulations 1981, Amendment No. 3), and 
sUbstituting the Second Schedule set out in the Schedule to these 
regulations. 

8. Revocation-Regulations 2 to 6 and 8 of, and the Schedule to, the 
Mining Regulations 1981, Amendment No. 3 are hereby revoked. 

Reg.7 SCHEDULE 

NEW SECOND SCHEDULE TO PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS 

Reg.4 "SECOND SCHEDULE 
FEES 

Prospector's right . . . . 
Application for exploration licence, 1 year or less 

More than 1 year and up to 2 years .. 
Application for prospecting licence . . . . 
Application for renewal of prospecting licence-

40 hectares or less 
Greater than 40 hectares 

Application for mining licence 

$ 

90 
9,562.50 

19,125 
2,250 

393.75 
1,125 
2,250 



1989/143 Mining Regulatioru 1981, Amendment No. 4 

SCHEDULE-continued 

NEW SECOND SCHEDULE TO PRINCIPAL REGULATIONs-continued 

"SECOND SCHEDULE -continued 

Application for authority to mine mineral not specified in 
mining licence . . . . . . . . . . 

Application for special-site licence 
Application for road, tramway, aerial ropeway, pipeline, 

tunnel, or bridge licence 
Application for easement certificate . . . . 
Application for moving-dredge easement certificate 
Surrender of mining privilege (or part) . . . . 
Application for duplicate licence or certificate under section 

134 of the Act . . . . . . . . . . 
Application by holder for variation of conditions under 

section 103D of the Act 
Application for Minister's consent under section 123 of the 

Act 

$ 

562.50 
2,250 

2,250 
2,250 
2,250 

No fee 

112.50 

1,687.50 

1,125 

539 

Application for Minister's consent under section 145 of the 
Act 1,125" 

MARIE SHROFF, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 

These regulations increase the fees and rent payable under the Mining Regulations 198 I to 
reflect the increase in goods and services tax from 10 percent to 12.5 percent. The increases 
come into force on 1 July 1989. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gautte: 1 June 1989. 
These regulations are administered in the Ministry of Energy. 


