
389 

1962/43 

THE MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS REGULATIONS 1956, 
AMENDMENT NO. 2 

COBHAM, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government Buildings at Wellington this 9th day of April 1962 

Present: 
THE RIGHT HaN. KEITH HOLYOAKE PRESIDING IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Municipal Corporations Act 1954, His Excellency the 
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Municipal Corporations 
Regulations 1956, Amendment No.2, and shall be read together with 
and deemed part of the Municipal Corporations Regulations 1956* 
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

2. Regulation 3 of the principal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the words "31st day of July", and substituting the words 
"30th day of June". 

3. Regulation 8 of the principal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the word "August" wherever it occurs, and substituting in each 
case the word "July". 

4. Regulation 9 of the principal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the word "August", and substituting the word "July". 

5. Regulation 10 of the principal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the word "August", and substituting the word "July". 

6. Regulation 16 of the principal regulations is hereby amended-
(a) By omitting the word "October", and substituting the word 

"September" : 
(b) By omitting the words "30th day of September", and substituting 

the words "31st day of August". 

*S.R. 1956/112 
Amendment No.1: S.R. 1959/121 



390 Municipal Corporations Regulations 1956, 
Amendment No.2 

1962/43 

7. The principal regulations are hereby further amended by inserting, 
after regulation 32, the following regulation: 

"32A. The Council may, by resolution, determine that shillings and 
pence shall be excluded from the accounts, balance sheet, and state­
ments required by regulation 32 hereof to be prepared, and in that case 
the Treasurer shall' prepare those accounts, balance sheet, and state­
ments accordingly." 

T. J. SHERRARD, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 
This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their 

general effect. 
Regulations 2 to 6 of these regulations make such changes in Part I of the 

principal regulations as are necessary following the alteration hy the Local 
Elections and Polls Amendment Act 1961 in the date for the holding of the general 
eleotions of City, Borough, and Town Councils from the third Saturday in 
November to the second Saturday in October. 

The dates before which certain formalities in connection with the enrolment 
of electors are to be complied with are advanced by a month in each case. 

Regulation 7 permits the annual accounts of City, B'Orough, and Town Councils 
to be prepared, if the Council S'O decides, on a whole-pounds basis, that is, 
excluding shillings and pence. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 12 April 1962. 
These regulations are administered in the Department of Internal Affairs. 


