
1020 

1967/170 

THE HONEY MARKETING AUTHORITY REGULATIONS 1964, 
AMENDMENT NO. 1 

BERNARD FERGUSSON, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington this 12th day of July 1967 

Present: 
HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Primary Products Marketing Act 1953, His Excellency 
the Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of 
the Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 
1. (1) These regulations may be cited as the Honey Marketing 

Authority Regulations 1964, Amendment No. 1, and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Honey Marketing Authority 
Regulations 1964* (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the day after the date 
of their notification in the Gazette. 

2. (1) Subclause (1) of regulation 20 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by omitting the words "of 1/32d. per t oz" and substi
tuting the words "at the rate of 0.834 of a cent per lb". 

(2) Subclause (2) of regulation 20 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by adding the following paragraphs: 

"( d) Any honey packed in containers containing more than 10 lb of 
honey and sold by a producer by wholesale for re-sale in the 
containers in which the honey has been packed by the 
producer: 

"( e) Any honey sold by a producer by retail at his apiary packed 
in the customer's own container." 

3. Subclause (1) of regulation 22 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by inserting, after paragraph (c), the following provisos: 

"Provided that in respect of honey packed in individual plastic or 
other containers containing approximately t oz of honey, a packer may 
make a written declaration to the Authority as to the total weight of 
honey packed by him in such containers over a specified period: 

*S.R. 1964/160 



1967/170 Honey Marketing Authority Regulations 1964, 
Amendment No. 1 

1021 

"Provided also that the levy shall be payable to the Authority calcu
lated on the weight of honey so declared by the packer: 

"Provided further that containers containing honey on which levy 
!has been paid in accordance with the first and second provisos of this 
paragraph shall not require to be labelled so as to indicate that the levy 
!has been paid." 

4. Sub clause (4) of regulation 29 of the principal regulations is 
hereby amended by omitting "£1,300" and substituting "$2,600" and 
omitting from the proviso thereto the words "one-twelfth of a penny" 
.and substituting the words "0.07 of a cent". 

5. Clause 4 of the First Schedule to the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by omitting paragraph (ii) of the Table appended to the 
dause, and substituting the following paragraph: 
"(ii) Votes exercisable according to amount of levy paid: 

Amount of Levy Number of Votes 

$18.68 and under $37.36 2 
$37.36 and under $74.72 4 
$74.72 and under $112.08 6 

$112.08 and under $149.44 8 
$149.44 and under $186.80 10 
$186.80 and under $224.16 12 
$224.16 and under $261.52 14 
$261.52 and under $298.88 16 
$298.88 and under $336.24 18 
$336.24 and under $373.60 20 
$373.60 and under $410.96 22 
$410.96 and under $448.32 24 
$448.32 and under $485.68 26 
$485.68 and under $523.04 28 
$523.04 and over 30" 

6. Clause 5 of the First Schedule to the principal regulations IS 

hereby amended by omitting "£9 6s. 8d.", and substituting "$18.68". 

7. Clause 17 of the First Schedule to the principal regulations is hereby 
amended by omitting "£3" from paragraph (d) and substituting "$6". 

P. J. BROOKS, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 
This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general 

.effect. 

These regUlations provide for necessary changes on the change to decimal 
.currency. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 13 July 1967. 
These "egulations are administered in the Department of Agriculture. 


