
734 

THE FISHERIES (GENERAL) REGULATIONS 1950, 
AMENDMENT NO. 25 

DENIS BLUNDELL, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government Buildings at Wellington this 27th day of June 1977 

Present: 
THE RIGHT HON. B. E. TALBOYS PRESIDING IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to the Fisheries Act 1908, His Excellency the Governor­
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and com.m.encem.ent-(l) These regulations may be cited 
as the Fisheries (General) Regulations 1950, Amendment No. 25, and 
shall be read together with and deemed part of the Fisheries (General) 
Regulations 1950* (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 30th day of June 
1977. 

2. Use of Danish seine net by l110re than 1 vessel-Regulation 
69 (3) of the principal regulations (as inserted by regulation 5 of the 
Fisheries (General) Regulations 1950, Amendment No. 20, and amended 
by regulation 2 of the Fisheries (General) Regulations 1950, Amendment 
No. 24) is hereby further amended by omitting the words "30th day of 
June 1977", and substituting the words "31st day of August 1977". 

3. Prohibited waters for use of Danish seine net-Regulation 
72 (10) of the principal regulations (as substituted by regulation 3 of the 
Fisheries (General) Regulations 1950, Amendment No. 19, and 
amended by regulation 6 of the Fisheries (General) Regulations 1950 

·S.R. 1950/147 (Reprinted with Amendment Nos. I to 20: S.R. 1973/52) 
Amendment No. 21: S.R. 1973/252 
Amendment No. 22: S.R. 1975/181 
Amendment No. 23: S.R. 1975/259 
Amendment No. 24: S.R. 1976/173 



1977 /167 Fisheries (General) Regulations 1950, 
Amendment No. 25 

735 

Amendment No. 20, and regulation 3 of the Fisheries (General) 
Regulations 1950, Amendment No. 24) is hereby further amended by 
omitting the words "30th day of June 1977", and substituting the word~ 
"31st day of August 1977". 

4. Revocation-The Fisheries (General) Regulations 1950, Amend­
ment No. 24, are hereby consequentially revoked. 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 
These regulations amend the Fisherie-s (General) Regulations 1950. The effect is to 

extend, until 31 August 1977, the provisions relating to Danish seining by more than I 
vessel, and to Danish seining in the Hauraki Gulf. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 30 .Tune 1977. 
These regulations are administered in the Ministry of Agriculture and Fisheries. 


