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THE EGG MARKETING EMERGENCY REGULATIONS 1942, 
AMENDMENT NO. 1 

C. L. N. NEW ALL, Governor-General. 

ORDER lIN LCOUNCIL. 
At the Government Buildings at Wellington, this 24th day of 

March, 1943. 
Present: 

THE HON. D. G. SULLIVAN PRESIDING IN COUNCIL. 

PURSUANT to the Emergency Regulations Act, 1939, His Excellency 
the Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of 
the Executive Council, doth hereby make the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS. 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Egg Marketing Emergency 

Regulations 1942, Amendment No. 1, and shall be read together with 
and deemed part of the Egg Marketing Emergency Regulations 1942* 
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

2. The powers conferred on the Minister by clause 4 of the principal 
regulations, with respect to the sale and purchase of eggs in special 
egg-marketing areas, are hereby extended so as to empower the 
Minister to give directions under that clause for regulating and 
controlling the sale and purchase of eggs in any other part of New 
Zealand, and to prohibit the sale of eggs in any case where the 
prohibition of such sale is, in his opinion, necessary for the proper 
regulation and control of the sale of eggs in any part of New Zealand. 

3. The provisions of section 5 of the Marketing Amendment Act, 
1937 (as to the delegation of powers by the Minister), shall apply with 
respect to all or any of the powers conferred on the Minister by the 
principal regulations (including these regulations). 

4. (1) The Director or any other officer of the Internal Marketing 
Division may require any person having for the time being possession 
or control of any eggs intended for sale (whether such person is the 
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owner of the eggs or not) to answer any inquiries relative to the source 
of production of such eggs or their ownership or their intended desti­
nation, and to carry out any instructions given by the officer for the 
purpose of giving effect to any directions given by or on account of 
the Minister for the purposes of the principal regulations or these 
regulations. 

(2) Every person commits an offence against the principal regula­
tions who refuses or fails to answer any inquiries put to him in 
accordance with this clause, or who gives any false or misleading 
information in relation thereto, or who refuses or fails to comply with 
any instruction" given by allY officer of the Department acting under 
the authority of this dause. 

T. J. SHERRARD, 
)ccting Clerk of Hle 11;xeeutive Council. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act, 193(;. 
Date of notification in Uazetle: 25th day of March, 194:L 
These regulations are administered in the InteJ'l1al Markctill,; lliyi,ion of the 

Marketing Department. 
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