
2098 

1986/383 

THE CUSTOMS REGULATIONS 1968, AMENDMENT NO. 26 

PAUL REEVES, Governor·General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At Wellington this 19th day of December 1986 

Present: 

HIS ExCElLENCY THE GoVERNOR·GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to sections 232 and 237 of the Customs Act 1966, His Excellency 
the Governor·General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and commencement-(l) These regulations may be cited as 
the Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 26 and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Customs Regulations 1968" 
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

·S.R. 1968/169 (Reprint<d with Amendment Nos. 1 to 9: S.R. 1975/284) 
Amendment No. 10: S.R. 1976/331 
Amendment No. 11: S.R. 1977/69 
Amendment No. 12: S.R. 1978/146 
Amendment No. 13: S.R. 1979/278 
Amendment No. 14: S.R. 1980/97 
Amendment No. 15: S.R. 1980/190 
Amendment No. 16: S.R. 1980/238 
Amendment No. 17: S.R. 1981/163 
Amendment No. 18: S.R. 1981/238 
Amendment No. 19: S.R. 1981/303 
Amendment No. 20: S.R. 1982/136 
Amendment No. 21: S.R. 1983/143 
Amendment No. 22: S.R. 1983/183 
Amendment No. 23: S.R. 1984/277 
Amendment No. 24: S.R. 1986/282 
Amendment No. 25: S.R. 1986/329 



1986/383 Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 26 2099 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the day after the date of 
their notification in the Gazette. 

2. Licence fee-(l) Regulation 135 (1) of the principal regulations (as 
substituted by regulation 6 of the Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment 
No. 11 and amended by regulation 9 of the Customs Regulations 1968, 
Amendment No. 15) is hereby further amended-

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "$70", and substituting 
the expression "$165": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (b) the expression "$12", and substituting 
the expression "$33' . 

(2) Regulation 135 (2) of the principal regulations (as so substituted) is 
hereby amended by omitting the words "15th day of January", and 
substituting the words "1st day of February". 

(3) The Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 15 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 9. 

8. Customs carriers-(l) Regulation 136 (2) of the principal regulations 
(as substituted by regulation 7 of the Customs Regulations 1968, 
Amendment No. 11 and amended by regulation 10 of the Customs 
Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 15) is hereby further amended: 

(a) By omitting from paragraph (a) the expression "$70", and substituting 
the expression "$165": 

(b) By omitting from paragraph (b) the expression "$12", and substituting 
the expression "$33' . 

(2) Regulation 136 (3) of the principal regulations (as so substituted) is 
hereby amended by omitting the words "15th day of January", and 
substituting the words "1st day of February". 

(3) The Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 15 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 10. 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

ThiJ note iJ not part of the regulatwns, but iJ intended to indicate their general eJfrct. 

These regulations, which come into force on the day after the date of their notification in 
the Gazette, amend the Customs Regulations 1968. 

RegulatWns 2 and .J increase the licence fees for Customs agents and Customs carriers, and 
extends the dates for the payment of the annual fees from 15 January to 1 February. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 22 December 1986. 
These regulations are administered in the Customs Department. 

WElLINGTON, NEW ZEALAND: Printed under the authority of the 
New Zealand Government by V. R. WARD, Government Printer-1987 

6S8S1E-87A 


