
1677 

1981/303 

THE CUSTOMS REGULATIONS 1968, AMENDMENT NO. 19 

DA VID BEATTIE, Governor-General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At the Government House at Wellington this 27th day of October 1981 

Present: 

HIS EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PCRSCA!\[T to the Customs Act 1966, His Excellency the Governor
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and commencement-( I) These regulations may be cited as 
the Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 19, and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Customs Regulations 1968* 
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 14th day after the 
date of their notification in the Gazette. 

2. Entry of goods imported in aircraft or ship--( I) Regulation 26 
(1) of the principal regulations (as amended by regulation 3 of the 
Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 10) is hereby further 
amended by omitting the expression "$50", and substituting the 
expression "$100". 

(2) The Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. I 0, are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 3. 

*S.R. 1968/169 (Reprinted with Amendments ;'\ios. I to 9: S.R. 19751284) 
Amendmenr No. 10 S.R. 1976/331 
Amendment 1\'0. 11: S.R. 1977169 
Amendment ~o. 12· S.R. 1977/146 
Amendment:"[o 13 S.R. 19781278 
Amendment No 14: S.R. 1979/97 
Amendment No 15: S.R. 19801190 
Amendment No. 16 S.R. 19801238 
Amendment 1'\0. 17: S.R. 19811163 
Amendment!'lo 18' S.R. 1981/238 



1678 Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 19 1981/303 

3. When entry for postal packets are not required-( I) Regulation 
144 (1) (a) of the principal regulations (as amended by regulation 7 of the 
Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 10) is hereby further 
amended by omitting the expression "$50", and substituting the 
expression "$100". 

(2) The Customs Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 10 are hereby 
consequentially amended by revoking regulation 7. 

P. G. MILLEN, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This nole is nol paTI of Ih. "gutalions, bul is inlroded 10 indical. Ih.iT gmtTa/ .flul. 

R'gutalions 2 and 3 raise the limit from $50 to $100 before goods imported in aircraft, ships, 
and postal packets are required to be entered by means of the lodgment of an import entry 
form with the Customs Department. 

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936. 
Date of notification in Gaztllt: 29 October 1981. 
These regulations are administered in the Customs Department. 


