
1340 

1992/198 

THE COAL MINES (OPENCAST COAL MINES) REGULATIONS 
1986, AMENDMENT NO. 1 

CA THERINE A. TIZARD, Governor·General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At Wellington this 13th day of July 1992 

Present: 

HER EXCELLENCY THE GOVERNOR·GENERAL IN COUNCIL 

PuRSUANT to the Coal Mines Act 1979, Her Excellency the Governor· 
General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, hereby makes the following regulations. 

REGULA nONS 
1. Tide and commencement-(I) These regulations may be cited as 

the Coal Mines (Opencast Coal Mines) Regulations 1986, Amendment 
No. 1, and shall be read together with and deemed part of the Coal Mines 
(Opencast Coal Mines) Regulations 1986" (hereinafter referred to as the 
pnncipal regulations). 

(2) These regulation shall come into force on the 28th day after the date 
of their notification in the Gazette. 

2. Fees inclusive of goods and services tax-The principal 
regulations are hereby amended by inserting, after regulation 2, the 
fonowing regulation: 

"2A. The Fees set out in these regulations are inclusive of goods and 
services tax under the Goods and Services Tax Act 1985." 

·S.R. 1986/277 



1992/198 Coal Mines (opencast Coal Mines) Regulations 1986, 
Amendment No. 1 

1341 

S. Opencast coal mine managers' certificates-(I) Regulation 3 (2) of 
the principal regulations is hereby amended-

(a) By omitting the expression "$10", and substituting the expression 
"$112.50": 

(b) By omitting the expression "$5", and substituting the expression 
"$84.38". 

(2) The said regulation 3 is hereby amended by inserting, after subclause 
(5), the following subclause: 

"(5A) The fee payable for each written examination and each subsequent 
examination in the same subject for the A·grade opencast coal mine 
manager's certificate shall be $22.50." 

•. Duplicate certificates of permits-Regulation 8 (4) (a) of the 
principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$5", 
and substituting the expression "$33.75". 

BOB MacF ARLANE, 
Acting for Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 
These regulations amend the Coal Mines (Opencast Coal Mines) Regulations 1986 by 

increasing various fees and prescribing a fee of$22.50 (inclusive of goods and service tax) for 
each written examination and each subsequent examination in the same subject for the A­
grade opencast coal mine manager's certificate. 

Issued under the authority of the Acts and Regulations Publication Act 1989. 
Date of notification in Gazette: 16 July 1992. 
These regulations are administered in the Ministry of Commerce. 


