83

THE CLEAN AIR (LICENSING) REGULATIONS 1973,
AMENDMENT NO. 2

PAUL REEVES, Governor-General

ORDER IN COUNCIL
At Wellington this 9th day of February 1987
Present:

His ExceLLENCY THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL IN COUNCIL

PURSUANT to the Clean Air Act 1972, His Excellency the Governor-General,
acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, hereby
makes the following regulations.

REGULATIONS

1. Title and commencement—(1) These regulations may be cited as
the Clean Air (Licensing) Regulations 1973, Amendment No. 2, and shall be
read together with and deemed part of the Clean Air (Licensing)
Regulations 1973% (hereinafter referred to as the principal regulations).

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of March 1987.

2. Scheduled process fees in respect of Part A processes—Regulation
10 (1) of the principal regulations gs substituted by regulation 2 of the
Clean Air (Licensing) Regulations 1973, Amendment No. 1) is hereby
a;_nfended by omitting the scale of fees, and substituting the following scale
of fees:

*S.R. 1973/308
Amendment No. 1: S.R. 1983/45



84 Clean Air (Licensing) Regulations 1973, 1987/17
Amendment No. 2

Amount charged in
respect of each

“Value of Current Replacement Cost Part A process
Not exceeding $1,000,000 $ 500
Exceeding $1,000,000 but not exceeding

$10,000,000 $1,200
Exceeding $10,000,000 but not exceeding

$100,000,000 $2,500
Exceeding $100,000,000 $5,000.”

8. Scheduled process fees in respect of Part B process—Regulation
104 (1) of the principal regulations (as substituted by regulation 2 of the
Clean Air (Licensing) Regulations 1973, Amendment No. 1) is hereby
amended by omitting the expression “$100”, and substituting the
expression “$300”.

4. Scheduled process fees in respect of Part C processes—Regulation
108 (1) of the principal regulations (as substituted by regulation 2 of the
Clean Air (Licensing) Regulations 1973, Amendment No. 1) is hereby
amended by omittung the expression “$50”, and substituting the
expression “$150”.

5.Fees in respect of applications under section 31 of the
Act—(1) Regulation 11 of the principal regulations (as substituted by
regulation 3 of the Clean Air (Licensing} Regulations 1973, Amendment No.
1) is hereby amended by revoking subclause (1), and substituting the
following subclause:

“(1) Subject to subclauses (2) to (6) of this regulation, the fee payable on

an application made under section 31 of the Act shall be—

“(a) In respect of each subject comprised in the application in respect of a
Part A process, a fee based on the value of the work involved in
relation to each subject, which fee shall be assessed by the
licensing authority in accordance with the following scale:

“Value of work Fee
Exceeding $100,000 but not exceeding

$1,000,000 $ 1,000
Exceeding $1,000,000 but not exceeding

$10,000,000 $ 3,000
Exceeding $10,000,000 but not exceeding

$100,000,000 $10,000
Exceeding $100,000,000 $30,000:

“(b) In respect of each subject which is comprised in the application in
respect of a Part B process and which involves work with a value
exceeding $100,000, $500:

“(c) In respect of each subject which is comprised in the application in
respect of a Part C process and which involves work with a value
exceeding $100,000, such amount (not exceeding $250) as the
licensing authority may by bylaw or resolution prescribe.”



1987/117 Clean Air (Licensing) Regulations 1973, 85
Amendment No. 2

(2) Regulation 11 (5) of the principal regulations (as so substituted) is
hereby amended by omitting the expression “subclause (1)(a)”, and
substituting the expression “su%clause (.

P. G. MILLEN,
Clerk of the Executive Council.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect.

These regulations, which come into force on 1 March 1987, increase the fees payable under
the Clean Air (Licensing) Regulations 1973.

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936.
Date of notification in Gazette: 12 February 1987.
These regulations are administered in the Department of Health.



