947

1976/167

THE ANIMAL REMEDIES (FEES) REGULATIONS 1968,
AMENDMENT NO. 1

DENIS BLUNDELL, Governor-General
ORDER IN COUNCIL
At the Government Buildings at Wellington this 21st day of June 1976

Present:
Tue Hon. J. B. Gorpon PRESIDING IN CoUuNaIL

PursuanT to the Animal Remedies Act 1967, His Excellency the
Governor-General, acting by and with the advice and consent of the
Executive Council, hereby makes the following regulations.

REGULATIONS

1. Title and commencement—(1) These regulations may be cited as
the Animal Remedies (Fees) Regulations 1968, Amendment No. 1, and
shall be read together with and deemed part of the Animal Remedies
(Fees) Regulations 1968* (hereinafter referred to as the principal
regulations).

7(2) These regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of July
1976

2. Licence fees—Regulation 3 of the principal regulations is hereby
ag)ended by omitting the expression “$5”, and substituting the expression
(14 305’.

3. Advertisement fee—Regulation 4 of the principal regulations is
hereby amended by omitting the expression “$1”, and substituting the
expression “$5”.

4. Analysis fee—Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is hereby
amended by omitting the expression “$20”, and substituting the
expression “$100”.

P. G. MILLEN,
Clerk of the Executive Council.
*S.R. 1968/11



948 Animal Remedies (Fees) Regulations 1968, 1976/167
Amendment No. 1

EXPLANATORY NOTE

ﬂThis note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general
effect.
These regulations amend the prescribed fees under the Animal Remedies Act
as follows—
(a) A licence application fee is increased from $5 to $30.
(b) The fee to accompany an application for approval of an advertisement
under section 41 (1) is increased from $1 to $5:
(c) The fee for an analysis of an animal remedy under section 45 is increased
from $20 to $100.

Issued under the authority of the Regulations Act 1936.
Date of notification in Gazette: 24 June 1976.
These regulations are administered in the Ministry of Agriculture and Fisheries.



