
2979 

1993/301 

THE ACCIDENT REHABILITATION AND COMPENSATION 
INSURANCE (COUNSELLING COSTS) REGULATIONS 1992, 

AMENDMENT NO. 2 

CA THERINE A. TIZARD, Governor·General 

ORDER IN COUNCIL 

At Wellington this 20th day of September 1993 

Present: 

THE RIGHT HON. J B. BOLGER PRESIDING IN COUNCIL 

PURSUANT to section 167 (1) (1) of the Accident Rehabilitation and 
Compensation Insurance Act 1992, Her Excellency the Governor·General, 
acting by and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, hereby 
makes the following regulations. 

REGULATIONS 

1. Title and commencement-(I) These regulations may be cited as 
the Accident Rehabilitation and Compensation Insurance (Counselling 
Costs) Regulations 1992, Amendment No. 2, and shall be read together 
with and deemed part of the Accident Rehabilitation and Compensation 
Insurance (Counselling Costs) Regulations 1992" (hereinafter referred to as 
the principal regulations). 

(2) These regulations shall come into force on the day after the date of 
their notification in the Gazette. 

·S.R. 1992/268 
Amendment No. I: S.R. 1993/199 



2980 Accident Rehabilitation and Compensation Insurance 
(Counselling Costs) Regulations 1992, 

Amendment No. 2 

1993/301 

2. Interim approval as counsellor-(I) Regulation 23 (1) of the 
principal regulations is hereby amended by omitting the words "1st day of 
October 1993", and substituting the words "1st day of May 1994". 

(2) Regulation 23 (2) of the frincipal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the words "1 st day 0 October 1993", and substituting the words 
"1st day of May 1994". 

(3) Regulation 23 (3) of the frincipal regulations is hereby amended by 
omitting the words "1st day 0 October 1993", and substituting the words 
"1st day of May 1994". 

(4) Regulation 23 of the principal regulations is hereby amended by 
revoking subclause (4), and substituting the following subclause: 

"(4) In subclauses (1), (2), and (3) of this regulation, the expression "1st 
day of May 1994" shall be read as "1st day of May 1995' in any case 
where the committee is satisfied that the person concerned has complied 
so far as it is practicable with the requirements for approval set out in 
regulation 20 of these regulations and is likely to have fully complied with 
those requirements before the 1 st day of May 1996." 

MARIE SHROFF, 
Clerk of the Executive Council. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

This note is not part of the regulations, but is intended to indicate their general effect. 

These regulations amend the Accident Rehabilitation and Compensation Insurance 
(Counselling Costs) Regulations 1992 by-

(a) Extending, by 7 months, to 1 May 1994 the period during which the interim approval of 
counsellors is valid for the purposes of payment: 

(b) Extending the date by which counsellors who have already received interim approval 
must fully comply with the requirements for approval set out in regulation 20, by 7 
months, to 1 May 1996. 

Issued under the authority of the Acts and Regulations Publication Act 1989. 
Date of notification in Gautte: 23 September 1993. 
These regulations are administered in the Accident Rehabilitation and Compensation 

Insurance Corporation. 


