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EXPLANATORY NOTE 

The amendments to clauses 10, 15, 19, and 20 (2) effect draftingimprove-
ments arid corrections. · 

Clause 20 (2): This amendment would empower the .Minister to suspend 
or tj.tncel the licence of a foreign fishing craft where a member of the craft 
fails to pay an administrative fine imposed under clause 24A within . the time 
required by that clause. 

Clause 21 ( 1) provides for authorised agents to be appointed in New 
Zealand in respect of foreign fishing craft and for service of documents on 
such agents. 

Clause 23: The effect of this amendment is to empower law enforcement 
officers to stop,. board, and inspect a foreign fishing craft, whether or not it is 
believed to have committed an offence in the zone. 

New clause 24A provides for the imposition of an administrative fine by the 
Minister, in lieu of criminal prosecution, where he is satisfied that an offence 
that is committed in respect of licensed foreign fishing craft in the exclusive 
economic zone is of a minor nature. 

Where it is intended to use this procedure, the Minister will cause a notice 
to be served on the defendant specifying particulars of the alleged offence, 
The defendant may within 28 days require that the matter should be dealt 
with by a Court. If he does not do so, he will be deemed to have admitted 
the offence. He may in any case admit the offence and make submissions in 
mitigation. 

Where an offence is admitted, the Minister may, after taking into account 
any submissions made by the defendant, impose a monetary penalty not 
exceeding one-third of the maximum fine a Court could impose for the offence. 
The craft will not be subject to forfeiture. 

The remaining amendments all effect minor drafting improvements or 
corrections. 


