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recidivist offenders who are 14 years old. It has more limited effects for fifteen 
and sixteen year olds. 

The current Act has no provision for the Youth Court to impose longer 
sentences for repeat offences. It is therefore possible for 14 year olds to commit 
three serious offences, serve the maximum term of detention immediately after 
each and to be released to offend again. 

For the purpose of this amendment a serious offence is defined as one for 
which an adult offender would be liable for a sentence of at least 14 years. For 
recidivist offenders, that is those who have already served a term in a residential 
institution following a conviction in the Youth Court, committing an offence for 
which an adult would be liable for a ten year sentence would mean that they 
could face a twelve month term imposed in the Youth Court. 

The amendment also allows some additional flexibility in the sentencing of 
15 and 16 year olds who currently are sometimes referred to the District Court 
for sentence. This amendment would give the Youth Court discretion up to 
twelve months instead of the current three. Again this would only apply to 
serious and recidivist offenders. 

Clause 38A: Extends the period for which a young person can be placed in the 
custody of the Director-General of Social Welfare from three to 12 months 
provided that the Youth Court finds the young person has committed an offence 
punishable by imprisonment for a term of 14 years or more or has previously 
had a custodial sentence imposed and the Court finds that the young person has 
committed an offence punishable by imprisonment for a term of IO years or 
more. 

Subclause (2) makes it clear that the increased penalty contemplated by the 
proposed new subsections (IA) and (ls) of section 311 is not to operate 
retrospectively. 

Clause 38e: Provides for young persons to be released after two·thirds of their 
sentence unless they have committed a further offence or absconded. 
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