[As REPORTED FROM THE COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE]
House of Representatives, 5 August 1991.

[Clauses 112 to 114 of this Bill were formerly clauses
112 to 114 of the Finance Bill (No. 2): 83-1]

Hon. Maurice McTigue

NATIONAL LIBRARY AMENDMENT

ANALYSIS
112. Accounts
Title 113. Annual reports
1. Short Title 114. Transitional provision

A BILL INTITULED
An Act to amend the National Library Act 1965
BE IT ENACTED by the Parliament of New Zealand as follows:

1. Short Title—This Act may be cited as the National

5  Library Amendment Act 1991, and shall be read together with

and deemed part of the National Library Act 1965 (%wreinafter
referred to as the principal Act).

112. Accounts—Section 25 (2) of the principal Act is hereby
amended by omitting the expression “31st day of March”, and
10 substituting the expression “30th day of June”.

113. Annual reports—(1) Section 30 (1) of the principal Act
(as enacted by section 11 of the National Library Amendment
Act 1989) is hcreby amended by omitting the expression “30th
day of September”, and substituting the expression “31st day

15 of October”.

(2) Section 30 (2) of the principal Act (as enacted by section
11 of the National Library Amendment Act 1989) is hereby
amended by omitting aR:e expression “section 39”, and
substituting the expression “section 44”.

No. 83—2G

Price
incl. GST $2.30



2 National Library Amendment

114. Transitional provision—(1) The Trustees shall not be
required, and shall be deemed never to have been required, by
section 25 (2) of the principal Act to prepare statements and
accounts in accordance with that section in respect of the
financial year ended with the 31st day of March 1991.

(2) The Trustees shall be required by section 25 (2) of the
princigal Act to prepare statements and accounts in accordance
with that section in respect of the year beginning on the 1st day
of July 1990 and ending with the 30th day of June 1991.

WELLINGTON, NEw 2EALAND: Published under the authority of the
New Zealand Government—1991
28008F ~91/N§



