[As RI:.PORTED FroM THE LANDS AND AGRICGULTURE
COMMITTEE]

House of Representatives, 31 August 1978.

Words struck out are shown in italics within bold round
brackets; words inserted are shown in roman underlined with
a double rule, or w1th double rule before first line and after
last lne.

Hon. Mr Gair

MINING AMENDMENT

ANALYSIS
Title ST 3.Entry on land for geological, etc.,
1. Short Tltle surveys
2. Public * reserves, etc., open for 4. Removing automatic right to
mining mining licence in National Parks

A BILL INTITULED
An Act to-amend the Mining Act 1971

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand
in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same,
9 as follows:

1. Short -Title—This Act: may be cited as the Mining
Amendment Act (1977) 1978, and shall be read together

with and deemed part of the N Mining Act 1971* (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act).

10 2. Public reserves, etc., open for mining— (1) Section 26
(4) of the principal Act is hereby amended by repealing the
proviso, and substituting the-following proviso:

“Provided that an exploration licence shall not be granted
in respect of land in a National Park or public reserve unless

15 the Minister of Energy has givcn the Minister of Lands not
less than 28 days notice of his intention to grant it.”

(2) Section 26 (5 ). of the pr1nc1pa1 Act is hereby amended
by adding the following proviso:
“Provided that in respect of land in a National Park, the

20 appropriate Minister shall be deemed to be the Minister of

~ Lands and the Minister of Energy acting jointly.”

- #1971, No:. 25 . , L
v Amendments: “1972; No. 83; 1973, No. 76; 1975, No. 91

: me s m T m L Eerrongmes TE Y N?)?T??—“? e S 8 et M e -
Price_ 10‘,611“4: R o e e T .



2 Mining Amendment

(3) Section 26 (8) of the principal Act is hereby amended
by omitting the words “Minister of Lands”, and substituting
the words “appropriate Minister”.

3. Entry on land for geological, etc., surveys—Section 39
(2) of the principal Act is hereby amended by adding the
following proviso:

“Provided that before the holder of an exploration licence
enters any National Park or public reserve by virtue of
section 66 of this Act, he shall give reasonable notice to the
controlling authority of the Park or reserve of his intention
to enter and shall, while on the land, comply with such
reasonable conditions as the controlling authority specifies.”

4. Removing automatic right to mining licence in National
Parks—Section 57 (1) of the principal Act is hereby amended
by adding the following proviso:

“Provided that the holder of a prospecting licence in respect
of land in a National Park within the meaning of the National
Parks Act 1952 shall not have such a right to have a mining
licence granted to him but, while the prospecting licence
continues in force, shall have the right in priority over any
other person to have one mining licence granted to him in
respect of any one part of the land to which the prospecting
licence relates.”

New

7 e )
5. Review of royalties—(1) Section 86 (1) of the principal
Act is hereby amended—

'(a) By omitting the words “ten years”, and substituting the

words “5 years”:

(b) By omitting the words “ten-yearly”, and substituting

the words “5-yearly”.

(2) Section 86 (2) of the principal Act is hereby amended
by omitting the words “ten years”, and substituting the words
“5 years”.

(3) The said section 86 is hereby further amended by add-
ing the following subsection:

“(5) The Minister may, in his discretion, at any time reduce
the rate of royalty payable under a mining licence.”

(4) Subsections (1) and (2) of this section shall apply only
in respect of mining licences granted on or after the date of
commencement of this section; and in respect of mining
licences granted before that date section 86 of the principal
Act shall continue to be read as if the said subsections (1)
and (2) had not been enacted.

S—]

WEeLLINGTON, NEW ZRALAND: Printed under the authority of the New Zealand
Government, by E. C. Keating, Government Printer—1977

10

15

20

25

30

35

40



