
FAIR TRADING AMENDMENT BILL (NO. 2)

AS REPORTED FROM THE COMMITTEE OF THE

WHOLE HOUSE

This bill was formerly part of the Courts and Crirninal Matters Bill, as reported
from theJustice and Law Reform Committee. The committee of the whole House
has further amended that bill and divided it intO the following bills:

• The Consumer Guarantees Amendment Bill, comprising Part lA
• The Credit Contracts Amendment Bill (No. 2), comprising Part 1

• The Disputes Tribunals Amendment Bill (No. 2), comprising Part 1 B
• The District Courts Amendment Bill (No. 2), comprising Part 2
• This bill, comprising Part 2A
• The Hire Purchase Amendment Bill, comprising Part 3

• The Summary Proceedings Amendment Bill (No. 6), comprising Part 5
• The Victims of Offences Amendment Bill, comprising Part 6.

Price Code: j

No. 91-SE



11

KEY TO SYMBOLS USED IN REPRINTED BILL

AS REPORTED FROM THE COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE

New

Subject to this Act, Text inserted



Hon Georgina te Heuheu

FAIR TRADING AMENDMENT (NO. 2)

Title

1. Short Title and commencement

ANALYSIS

7 B. Other orders

A BILL INTITULED

An Act to amend the Fair Trading Act 1986

BE IT ENACTED by the Parliament of New Zealand as follows:

1. Short Title and commencement-(1) This Act may be
5 cited as the Fair Trading Amendment Act (No. 2) 1999, and is

part of the Fair Trading Act 1986 ("the principal Act").
(2) This Act comes into force on the day after the date on

which it receives the Royal assent.

New

1 1

10 78. Other orders-(1) Section 43 (4) of the principal Act is
amended by omitting the expression "$3,000" wherever it
occurs, and substituting in each case the expression "$ 7,500".

(2) Section 43 (4A) of the principal Act is amended-
(a) By omitting the expression ' $3,000", and substituting the

15 expression "$7,500"; and
(b) By omitting the expression "$5,000", and substituting the

expression "$12,000".
1 1

WFLI.INGTON. NEW ZE.V-AND Published under the authority of the
New Zealand Governnen[-1999

No. 91-SE

31837 --99


