
[As REPORTED FROM THE COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE]
House of Representatives, 20 September 1976,

Words struck out by the Committee are shown in italics
within bold round brackets; words inserted are shown in
roman underlined with a double rule.

Hon. Mr Holland

ELECTRICIANS AMENDMENT

ANALYSIS

Title
1. Short Title

2. Experience gained in asmisting to do
electrical wiring work

3. Provisional licences

4. Persons who may do electricar
wiring work

5. Electrical wiring work which may
be done by any person

6. Persons who may assist in doing
electrical wiring work

7. Work dangerous to life
8. False or fraudulent representations

to Board
9. Other offences

A BILL INTITULED

amend the Electricians Act 1952An Act to

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand
in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same,

5 as follows:

1. Short Title-This Act may be cited as the Electricians
Amendment Act 1976, and shall be read together with and
deemed part of the Electricians Act 1952* (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act).

10 2. Experience gained in assisting to do electrical wiring
work-Section 11F of the principal Act (as inserted by section
5 of the Electricians Amendment Act 1969) is hereby
amended by inserting, after the word "sections", the expression
"114:

*1957 Reprint, Vol. 4, p. 541
Amendments: 1960, No. 60;

No. 15
1966, No. 32; 1967, No. 73; 1969, No. 10; 1975,

No. 25-2



2 Electricians Amendment

3. Provisional licences- (1) Section 16 of the principal Act
(as substituted by section 8 of the Electricians Amendment
Act 1969) is hereby amended by inserting, before the words
"The Board", the expression "(1)".

( 2) Section 16 of the principal Act is hereby further 5
amended by adding the following subsection:

"(2) Any such licence may at any time during the currency
thereof be withdrawn by the Board if the conditions thereof
have not been met."

4. Persons who may do electrical wiring work-Section 10
20 (2) of the principal Act is hereby amended by omitting
the words "The authorised person who carries out the inspec-
tion, testing, and supervision shall be either the person who
undertakes the work or a full-time employee of that person",
and substituting the words "Where any authorised person is 15
employed part time, a register shall be kept of all such
inspections and tests and shall be available for scrutiny by any
person authorised in writing by the Board".

5. Electrical wiring work which may be done by any
person-Section 20A of the principal Act (as inserted by 20
section 2 of the Electricians Amendment Act 1960) is hereby
amended by adding, after subsection (3), the following
subsection:

" (4) Where the Board considers it desirable to do so, the
Board may authorise any person or class of persons to under- 25
take the work specified in subsection (1) of this section during
the course of his or their employment and such authority
shall be on such conditions as imposed by the Board. Any such
authority may at any time during its currency be withdrawn
at the discretion of the Board." 30

6. Persons who may assist in doing electrical wiring work-
(1) Section 21 (2) of the principal Act is hereby amended by
inserting, before the words "section 11 c" (as substituted by
section 7 of the Electricians Amendment Act 1975), the words
"section 11A or . 35

(2) Section 21 (2) of the principal Act is hereby further
amended by adding the words "Any permission to assist in
doing electrical wiring work granted under this section may
be withdrawn by the Board if the conditions are not met."



Electricians Amendment

7. Work dangerous to life-(1) Section 31 of the principal
Act is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$400"
( as substituted by section 19 of the Electricians Amendment
Act 1969), and ,substituting the expression "(85,000) $2,000".

5 (2) The Electricians Amendment Act 1969 is hereby con-
sequentially amended by repealing section 19.

8. False or fraudulent representations to Board-( 1) Sec-
tion 32 of the principal Act is hereby amended by omitting
the expression "$200" (as substituted by section 20 of the

10 Electricians Amendment Act 1969), and substituting the
expression "$500".

( 2) The Electricians Amendment Act 1969 is hereby
consequentially amended by repealing section 20.

9. Other offences-( 1) Section 33 (1) of the principal Act
15 is hereby amended by omitting the expression "$200" (as

substituted by section 21 (a) of the Electricians Amendment
Act 1969), and substituting the expression "$500".

(2) Section 33 (2) of the principal Act is hereby amended
by omitting the expression "$80" ( as substituted by section

20 21 (b) of the Electricians Amendment Act 1969), and
substituting the expression "$500".

(3) The Electricians Amendment Act 1969 is hereby con-
sequentially amended by repealing paragraphs (a) and (b)
of section 21.

WELLINGTON, NEW ZEALAND : Printed under the authority of the New Zealand
Government, by A. R. SHEARER, Government Printei-1976

3


