
624 Estate and Gift Duties Amendment 1964, No. 74 

ANALYSIS 

Title 5. Group superannuation benefits 
1. Short Title 
2. Rates of estate duty 
3. General powers of appointment 

6. Meaning of "disposition of pro­
perty" 

7. Gift statements 
Schedule. 4. Joint property 

1964, No. 74 

An Act to amend the Estate and Gift Duties Act 1955 
[18 November 1964 

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand 
in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, 
as follows: 

1. Short Title-This Act may be cited as the Estate and 
Gift Duties Amendment Act 1964, and shall be read together 
with and deemed part of the Estate and Gift Duties Act 
1955 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act). 

2. Rates of estate duty- ( 1) The principal Act is hereby 
amended by repeaHng the First Schedule (as substituted by 
section 2 of the Estate and Gift Duties Amendment Act 
1961), and substituting the First Schedule set out in the 
Schedule to this Act. 

(2) The following enactments are hereby consequentially 
repealed: 

(a) Section 2 of the Estate and Gift Duties Amendment 
Act 1961: 

(b) So much of the Schedule to the Estate and Gift Duties 
Amendment Act 1961 as relates to the First Schedule 
to the principal Act. 



1964, No. 74 E~tate and Gift Duties Amendment 625 

(3) This section shall be deemed to have come into force 
on the twenty-fifth day of June, nineteen hundred and sixty­
four, and shaH apply to the estates of all persons dying on or 
after that date. 

3. General powers of appointment-( 1) Subsection (1) of 
section 2 of the principal Act is hereby amended by revoking 
the definition of the term "general power of appointment", 
and substituting the following definition: 

" 'General power of appointment' includes any power or 
authority which enables the donee or other holder 
thereof, or would enable him if he was of full capac­
ity, to obtain or appoint or dispose of any property, 
or to charge any sum of money upon any property, 
as he thinks fit for his own benefit, whether exercis­
able orally or by instrument inter vivos or by will or 
otherwise howsoever, but does not include any power 
exercisable by a person in a fiduciary capacity under 
a disposition not made by himself, or exercisable as 
mortgagee: ". 

(2) The Trustee Act 1956 is hereby amended by repealing 
so much of the Third Schedule as relates to the Estate and 
Gift Duties Act 1955. 

4. Joint property-( 1) Section 5 of the principal Act is 
hereby amended by repealing paragraph (e) of subsection 
(1). 

(2) Section 5 of the principal Act is hereby further 
amended by repealing paragraph (i) of subsection (1), and 
substitutin~ the following paragraph: 

"(i) The beneficial interest held by the deceased immedi­
ately before his death in any property as a joint 
tenant or joint owner with any other person or 
persons if that property was situated in New Zea­
land at the death of the deceased:". 

(3) This section shall come into force on the first day of 
April, nineteen hundred and sixty-five, and shall apply to 
the estates of all persons dying on or after that date. 

5. Group superannuation benefits-( 1) Subsection (1) of 
section 2 of the principal Act is hereby amended by inserting, 
after the definition of the term "general power of appoint­
ment", the following definition: 



626 Estate and Gift Duties Amendment 1964, No. 74 

"'Group superannuation scheme' means-
" (a) Any fund, plan, or scheme under the Super­

annuation Act 1956, or the National Provident Fund 
Act 1950: 

"(b) Any superannuation fund, plan, or scheme 
established for the benefit of the employees of an 
employer or any class or classes of those employees: 

" ( c) Any superannuation fund established for the 
benefit of contributors thereto otherwise than as em­
ployees of any employer, and approved by the Com­
missioner for the purposes of the Land and Income 
Tax Act 1954:". 

(2) Subsection (1) of section 2 of the principal Act is 
hereby further amended by repealing the definition of the 
term "superannuation fund" (as substituted by subsection (1) 
of section 2 of the Estate and Gift Duties Amendment Act 
1959). 

(3) Section 5 of the principal Act is hereby amended by 
adding to subsection (1) the following paragraph: 

"(k) Any pension or other benefit which is payable or 
granted out of or under a group superannuation 
scheme on or in consequence of the death of the 
deceased (whether pursuant to a pre-existing right 
or an election or the exercise of a discretion or 
otherwise howsoever) if the deceased was domi­
ciled in New Zealand at his death." 

( 4) Section 5 of the principal Act (as amended by sub­
section (1) of section 12 of the Estate and Gift Duties 
Amendment Act 1960) is hereby further amended by adding 
the following subsection: 

"( 6) For the purposes of paragraph (k) of subsection (1) 
of this section the following provisions shall apply: 

"( a) Where the benefit is a pension payable or granted out 
of or under a group superannuation scheme to the 
widow of the deceased for the rest of her life or 
during her widowhood <that pension shall not be 
deemed to be included in the dutiable estate of the 
deceased unless its amount exceeds five hundred 
pounds a year, in which case it shall not be deemed 
to be included in the dutiable estate to the extent 
of five hundred pounds a year: 

"Provided that where two or more pensions are 
payable or granted to a widow the amount so 
exempted in respect of each pension shall, where 
necessary, be reduced proportionately so that the 
total amount exempted in respect of all the pen­
sions does not exceed five hundred pounds a year: 



1964, No. 74 Estate and Citt Duties Amendment 627 

" (b) Where Ithe benefit is a pension payable or granted out 
of or under a group superannuation scheme to, or 
for the benefit of, an infant child of the deceased 
until that child attains an age not greater than 
twenty-one years, that pension shall not be deemed 
Ito be included in the dutiable estate of the 
deceased. " 

( 5) Subsection (2) of section 5 of the principal Act is 
hereby amended by repealing paragraphs (e) and (f) (as 
substituted by section 3 of the Estate and Gift Duties Amend­
ment Act 1959), and substituting the following paragraph: 

" ( e) Paragraph (g) of subsection (1) of this section shall 
not apply to any pension or other benefit under a 
group superannuation scheme." 

(6) Subsection (1) of section 2 of the principal Act is here­
by consequentially amended by repealing the definition of the 
term "contributor" (as substituted by subsection (2) of sec­
tion 2 of the Estate and Gift Duties Amendment Act 1959). 

(7) Section 16 of the principal Act is hereby amended by 
adding to subsection (1) the words "and includes any person 
who on the death of the deceased or in consequence of the 
death of the deceased acquires any benefit out of or under a 
group superannuation scheme, so far as that benefit is in­
cluded in the dutiable estate of the deceased". 

( 8) Section 48 of the principal Act is hereby amended­
(a) By omitting the words "contributor to any superannua­

tion fund", and substituting the words "member or 
participant of or in any group superannuation 
scheme"; 

(b) By omitting the words "the fund" in each place where 
they occur, and substituting in each case the words 
"the group superannuation scheme". 

(9) The Estate and Gift Duties Amendment Act 1959 is 
hereby amended by repealing subsections (1) and (2) of 
section 2, and subsection (1) of section 3. 

6. Meanjng of "disposition of property"-Section 42 of the 
principal Act is hereby amended by adding the following 
subsection: 

"( 4) For the purposes of this section a disclaimer of an inter­
est under a disposition made inter vivos or by will or of an 
interest under an intestacy shall not constitute a disposition of 
property." 



628 Estate and Gift Duties Amendment 1964, No. 74 

7. Gift statements-( 1) Subsection (1) of section 59 of 
the principal Act is hereby amended by omitting the words 
"five hundred pounds" in each place where they occur, and 
substituting in each case the words "one thousand pounds". 

(2) Section 61 of the principal Act is hereby amended by 
omitting the words "five hundred pounds", and substituting 
the words "one thousand pounds". 



1964, No. 74 Estate and Gift Duties Amendment 629 

SCHEDULE 
Section 2 

NEW FIRST 'SCHEDULE TO PRINCIPAL ACT 

Final Balance 
of Estate 

Not exceeding 
£4,000 
£4,001- £5,000 
£5,001- £6,000 

£6,001- £7,000 

.£7,001- £8,000 

£8,001- £9,000 

£9,001- £10,000 

£10,001- £11,000 

£11,001- £12,000 

£12,001- £14,000 

£14,001- £16,000 

£16,001- £18,000 

£18,001- £20,000 

£20,001- £22,000 

£22,001- £24,000 

£24,001- £26,000 

£26,001- £28,000 

£28,001- £30,000 

£30,001- £32,000 

£32,001- £34,000 

£34,001- £36,000 

"FIRST SCHEDULE 

SCALE OF RATES OF ESTATE DuTY 

Ralte 

Nil 
5 per cent of excess of the final balance over £4,000. 
£50 plus 7 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£5,000. 
£120 plus 9 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£6,000. 
£210 plus 11 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£7,000. 
£320 plus 13 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£8,000. 
£450 plus 15 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£9,000. 
£600 plus 17 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£10,000. 
£ 770 plus 19 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£11,000. 
£960 plus 15 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£12,000. 
£ 1,260 plus 17 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£14,000. 
£1,600 plus 19 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£16,000. 
£1,980 plus 21 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£18,000. 
£2,400 plus 23 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£20,000. 
£2,860 plus 25 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£22,000. 
£3,360 plus 27 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£24,000. 
£3,900 plus 29 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£26,000. 
£4,480 plus 31 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£28,000. 
£5,100 plus 33 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£30,000. 
£5,760 plus 35 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£32,000. 
£6,460 plus 37 per cent of excess of the final balance over 

£34,000. 



630 Estate and Gift Duties Amendment 

"FIRST SCHEDULE-continued 
SCALE OF RATES OF ESTATE DUTY-continued 

Rate 

1964, No. 74 

£ 7,200 plus 39 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£36,000. 

£ 7,980 plus 41 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£38,000. 

£8,800 plus 43 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£40,000. 

£9,660 plus 45 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£42,000. 

£ 10,560 plus 47 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£44,000. 

£11,500 plus 49 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£46,000. 

£12,480 plus 43 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£48,000. 

£13,770 plus 45 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£51,000. 

£15,120 plus 47 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£54,000. 

£16,530 plus 49 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£57,000. 

£ 18,000 plus 51 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£60,000. 

£19,530 plus 53 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£63,000. 

£21,120 plus 55 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£66,000. 

£22,770 plus 57 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£69,000. 

£24,480 plus 59 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£72,000. 

£26,250 plus 51 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£75,000. 

£28,800 plus 53 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£80,000. 

£31,450 plus 55 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£85.000. 

£34,200 plus 57 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£90,000. 

£37,050 plus 59 per cent of excess of the final balance over 
£95,000. 

40 per cent of the final balance." 

This Act is administered in rhe Inland Revenue Department. 


