1990, No. 41

Commerce Amendment

601

ANALYSIS

Title
1. Short Title and commencement
2. Interpretation
8. Certain terms defined in relation to
competition
4. Commussion to consider efficiency
5. Application of Act to conduct outside
New Zealand
6. New sections inserted
6a. Special provisions relating to
application of Act to the
Crown in right of Australia
and to Australian Crown
corporations
68. Crown and Crown corporations
not immune from jurisdic-
tion in relation to certain
rovisions of Trade Prac-
tices Act 1974
6c. Application of Evidence
Amendment Act 1980
7. Establishment of Commission
8. Disclosure of financial interests
9. Assent to determination
10. New sections substituted
18. Officers and employees
18a. Personnel rolicy
18p. Equal employment
opportunities
18¢. Choice of procedure
18p. Superannuation and retiring
allowances
11. Accounts and audit
12. Commission to have regard to econo-
mic policies of Government
18. Contracts, arrangements, or under-
standings containing exclusionary
rovisions prohibited
14. Use of dominant position in a market
15. Use of dominant position in trans-Tas-
man markets
16. Exceptions in relation to copyright, pat-
ents, plant varieties, registered
designs, and trademarks
17. Section 46 repealed

A—21

18. New Part HII substituted

PART III
BUSINESS ACQUISITIONS
47. Certain acquisitions prohibited
48. Bare transfer of market domi-
nance excluded
19. New sections substituted
58. Commission may grant authori-
sation for restrictive trade
ractices
584. Effect of authorisation
588. Additional provisions relating
to authorisations
20. Authorisation not to be granted in rela-
tion to contracts, etc., made before
determination by Commission
21. Determination of applications for
authorisation of restrictive trade
ractices
22. Section 63 repealed
28. New sections substituted

Business Acquisitions
66. Commission may give clear-

ances for business
acquisitions
67. Commussion may grant

authorisations for business
acquisitions

68. Provisions applying to applica-
tions for clearances and
authorisations for business

acquisitions

69. Effect of clearance or
authorisation

69a. Commission may  accept
undertakin;

698. Conferences in relation to bus-
iness acquisitions

24. Commission may authorise provisional

rice
25. Jurisdiction of High Court

26. Lay members of High Court in certain

cases
- 27. Evidence not otherwise admissible

28. Pecuniary penalties



602 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

29. New section substituted 98c. Commission may exercise
powers  notwithstanding

Business Acquisitions other proceedings
83. Pecuniary penalties 98H. Supply of information and

30. Injunctions may be granted by Court documents in  relation to

for contravention of Part III section ?6A .
X . 35. Powers of Commission to take evidence
31. Actions for damages for contravention

36. Commission may receive information
of Part Iff and documents on behalf of Austra-
lian Trade Practices Commission

37. Offences
83. Persons entitled to appeal 38. Dclegan_o n by Commission
34 N . bstituted 89. Proceedings privileged
- New sections substitute _ 40. Judicial notice
98. Commission ma{ require per- 41. Annual report
son to supply information 49
or documents or give
evidence
98a. Power to search
988. Powers conferred by warrant

32. Court may order divestiture of assets or
shares m respect of contravention of
Part III

. Regulations

48. Transitional provisions repealed

44. First Schedule repealed

45. Human Rights Commission Act 1977
amendedg

98c. Warrant to be produced 46. Consequential amendment to Broad-
98p. Other duties of person who casting Act 1989
executes a warrant 47. Amendment to Radiocommunications
98E. Duty to assist Act 1989
98r. Power to inspect and take 48. Transitional provisions in relation to
copies of documents, etc. mergers and takeovers
1990, No. 41

An Act to amend the Commerce Act 1986
[29 June 1990

BE IT ENACTED by the Parliament of New Zealand as follows:

1. Short Title and commencement—(1) This Act may be
cited as the Commerce Amendment Act 1990 and shall be read
together with and deemed part of the Commerce Act 1986
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act).

(2) Except as provided in subsection (3) of this section, this
Act shall come into force on the 1st day of July 1990.

(3) Sections 2 (1), (3), (4), (5), and (6), 17, 18, 23, 25, 26 (except
subsection (1) (b)), 27, 29, 30, 31, 32, 88, 44, 46, 47, and 48 of
this Act shall come into force on the 1st day of January 1991.

2. Interpretation—(1) Section 2 (1) of the principal Act is
hereby amended by inserting, after the definition of the
expression “arrive at”, the following definition:

“‘Assets’ includes intangible assets:”.

(2) Section 2 (1) of the principal Act is hereby further
amended by inserting, after the definition of the term
“person”, the following definition:

“‘Place’ includes any premises, building, aircraft, ship,
carriage, vehicle, or receptacle:”.

(3) Section 2 (1) of the principal Act is hereby further
amended by inserting, after the definition of the term
“services”, the following definition:



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 603

“ ‘Share’ means a share in the share capital of a company
or other body corporate, whether or not it carries the
right to vote at general meetings; and includes—

“(a) A beneficial interest in any such share:

“(b) A power to exercise, or control the exercise of,
a right to vote attaching to any such share that carries
the right to vote at general meetings:

“(c) A power to acquire or dispose of, or control the
acquisition or disposition of, any such share:

“(d) A perietual debenture and perpetual
debenture stock:”.

(4) Section 2 (1) of the principal Act is hereby further
amended by repealing the definition of the term “substantial”.

(5) Section 2 of the principal Act is hereby amended by
inserting, after subsection (1), the following subsection:

“(1a) In this Act (except section 47 (3) and (4)) ‘substantial’
means real or of substance.”

(6) Section 2 of the principal Act is hereby amended by
repealing subsection (7), and substituting the following
subsection:

“(7) For the purposes of this Act, any 2 bodies corporate are
to be treated as interconnected if—

“(a) One of them is a body corporate of which the other is a
subsidiary (within the meaning of section 158 of the
Companies Act 1955); or

“(b) Both of them are subsidiaries (within the meaning of that
section) of the same body corporate; or

“(c) Both of them are interconnected with bodies corporate
that, in accordance with paragraph (a) or paragraph
(b) of this subsection, are interconnected—

and ‘interconnected bodies corporate’ has a corresponding
meaning.”

3. Certain terms defined in relation to competition—
(1) Section 3 of the principal Act is hereby amended by
repealing subsection (1), and substituting the following
subsections:

“(1)In this Act ‘competition’ means workable or effective
competition.

“(1a) Every reference in this Act, except the reference in
section 364 (1) (b) and (c) of this Act, to the term ‘market’ is a
reference to a market in New Zealand for goods or services as
well as other goods or services that, as a matter of fact and
commercial common sense, are substitutable for them.



604 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

“(18) The reference in section 86a (1) (b) of this Act to the
tern ‘market’, in relation to a market in Australia, is a
reference to a market in Australia for goods or services as well
as other goods or services that, as a matter of fact and
commercial common sense, are substitutable for them.

“(1c) The reference in section 36a (1) (c) of this Act to the
term ‘market’ in relation to a market in New Zealand and
Australia, is a reference to a market in New Zealand and
Australia for goods or services as well as other goods or services
that, as a matter of fact and commercial common sense, are
substitutable for them.”

(2) Section 3 (8) of the principal Act is hereby amended by
omitting the expression “sections 36, 66, and 67”, and
substituting the expression “sections 36 and 36a”.

(3) Section 3 of the princi[gal Act is hereby amended by
adding, as subsection (9), the following subsection:

“(9) For the purposes of sections 47 and 48 of this Act, a
person has, or 2 more persons that are interconnected or
associated together have, as the case may be, a dominant
position in a market if that person as a supplier or an acquirer,
or those persons as suppliers or acquirers, of goods or services,
is or are In a position to exercise a dominant influence over the
production, acquisition, supply, or price of goods or services in
that market and for the purposes of determining whether a
person is, or 2 or more persons that are interconnected or
associated, are, in a position to exercise a dominant influence
over the production, acquisition, supply, or price of goods or
services in a market regard shall be had to—

“(a) The share of the market, the technical knowledge, the
access to materials or capital of that person or those
persons:

“(b) The extent to which that person is, or those persons are,
constrained by the conduct of competitors or
potential competitors in that market:

“(c) The extent to which that person is, or those persons are,
constrained by the conduct of suppliers or acquirers
of goods or services in that market.”

4. Commission to consider efficiency—The principal Act
is hereby amended by inserting, after section 3, the following
section:

“8A. Where the Commission is required under this Act to
determine whether or not, or the extent to which, conduct will
result, or will be likely to result, in a benefit to the public, the
Commission shall have regard to any efhiciencies that the



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 605

Commission considers will result, or will be likely to result,
from that conduct.”

5. A%plication of Act to conduct outside New
Zealand—The principal Act is hereby amended by repealing
section 4 and substituting the following section:

“4. (1) This Act extends to the engaging in conduct outside
New Zealand by any person resident or carrying on business in
New Zealand to the extent that such conduct affects a market
in New Zealand.

“(2) Without limiting subsection (1) of this section, section
864 of this Act extends to the engaging in conduct outside New
Zealand by any person resident or carrying on business in
Australia to the extent that such conduct affects a market, not
being a market exclusively for services, in New Zealand.”

6. New sections inserted—The pn'ncifpal Act is hereby
amended by inserting, after section 6, the following sections:

“6a. Special provisions relating to application of Act to
the Crown in right of Australia and to Australian Crown
corporations—Section 36A of this Act, and Parts VI and VII
of this Act, in so far as they relate to a contravention of, or
confer powers that may be exercised in relation to, that section,
apply to—

“(a) The Crown in right of the Commonwealth of Australia,

each of the States of the Commonwealth of
Australia, and the Northern Territory and the
Australian Capital Territory, in so far as the Crown
engages in trade; and

“(b) Every body corporate that is an authority of the

Commonwealth of Australia within the meaning of
section 4 of the Trade Practices Act 1984 of the
Parliament of the Commonwealth of Australia in so
far as it engages in trade; and

“(c) Every body corporate established for a purpose of a State

of the Commonwealth of Australia by or under a
law of that State in so far as it engages in trade; and

“(d)Every body corporate in which a State of the

Commonwealth of Australia or in which a body
corporate referred to in paragraph (c) of this section
has a controlling interest in so far as it engages in
trade.

“68. Crown and Crown corporations not immune from
jurisdiction in relation to certain provisions of Trade



606 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

Practices Act 1974—Neither the Crown nor a body corporate
that is an instrument of the Crown in respect of the
Government of New Zealand is immune, and neither the
Crown nor such a body corporate may claim immunity, from
the jurisdiction of the courts of New Zealand and Australia in
relation to a contravention of section 46a of the Trade Practices
Act 1974 of the Parliament of the Commonwealth of Australia
and in relation to Parts VI and XII of that Act in so far as they
relate to a contravention of that section.

“6c. Application of Evidence Amendment Act 1980—
Nothing in the Evidence Amendment Act 1980 applies in
relation to the application of section 464 of the Trade Practices
Act 1974 of the Parliament of the Commonwealth of Australia
or Parts VI and XII of that Act in so far as they relate to a
contravention of that section.”

7. Establishment of Commission—Section 8 of the
principal Act is hereby amended by repealing subsection (4).

8. Disclosure of financial interests—The principal Act is
hereby amended by repealing section 14, and substituting the
following section:

“14. (1) If the Chairman is taking part, or is to take part, in
the consideration or determination by the Commission of a
matter that relates to or affects a business or body corporate in
which the Chairman has an interest that, in accordance with
the rules of natural justice, disqualifies, or would disqualify, the
Chairman from taking part in the consideration or
determination of that matter,—

“(a) The Chairman shall disclose that interest to the Minister
in writing; and
“(b) The Chairman shall not continue to take part, or take

part, in the consideration or determination of the
matter.

“(2) If a member of the Commission is taking part, or is to
take part, in the consideration or determination by the
Commnission of a matter that relates to or affects a business or
body corporate in which that member has an interest that, in
accordance with the rules of natural justice, disqualifies, or
would disqualify, the member from taking part in the
consideration or determination of that matter,—

“(a) The member shall disclose that interest to the Chairman;
and



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 607

“(b) The member shall not continue to take part, or take
part, in the consideration or determination of the
matter.”

9. Assent to determination—Section 17 of the principal
Act is herel?' amended by inserting, after the word “telex”, the
words “or fascimile”.

10. New sections substituted—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing section 18, and substituting the
following sections:

“18. Officers and employees—(1) The Commission may
from time to time appoint such employees (including
employees on secondment from other organisations) as it thinks
necessary for the efficient performance and exercise of its
functions and powers, and, subject to subsection (2) of this
section, may at any time remove any employee from office or
employment.

*(2) Employees ap(fointed under subsection (1) of this section
sh be employed on such terms and conditions of
employment and shall be paid such salaries and allowances as
the Commission from time to time determines.

“(8) Subject to the terms and conditions of employment, the
Commission may at any time terminate or suspend the
employment of any employee.

“(4)No person shall be deemed to be in the service of the
Crown or In any part of the State services within the meanin:
of the State Sector Act 1988 by reason only of being employe
under this section.

“18A. Personnel Eolicy—sll) The Commission shall operate
a personnel policy that complies with the principal of being a
good employer.

“(2) For the purposes of this section, a ‘good employer’ is an
employer who operates a personnel policy containin
provisions generally accepted as necessary for the fair an
proper treatment of employees in all aspects of their
employment, including provisions requiring—

“(2) Good and safe working conditions; and

“(b) An equal employment opportunities programme; and

“(c) The impartial selection of suitably qualified persons for

appointment; and

“(d) Recognition of —

“(i) The aims and aspirations of the Maori people;
an



608 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

“(ii) The employment requirements of the Maori
people; and
“(ii)) The need for greater involvement of the
Maori people as employees of the employer
operating the personnel policy; and
“(e) Opportunities for the enhancement of the abilities of
individual employees; and
“f Recoilf.li_tion of the aims and aspirations, and the cultural
ifferences, of ethnic or minority groups; and
“(8) Recogihition of the employment requirements of women;
an

“(h) Recognition of the employment requirements of persons
with disabilities.

“18s. Equal employment opportunities—(1) The
Commission—

“(a)Shall in each year develop and publish an equal

employment opportunities programme:

“(b) Shall ensure in each year that the equal employment
oP};lortunities programme for that year is complied
with.

“(2) For the purposes of this section and section 18a of this
Act, an equal emPloyment opﬁortunities programme means a
programme that is aimed at the identification and elimination
of all aspects of policies, procedures, and other institutional
barriers that cause or perpetuate, or tend to cause or
perpetuate, inequality in respect of the employment of any
persons or group of persons.

“18c. Choice of procedure—Where the circumstances
giving rise to a personal grievance by a person em%loyed by the
Commission are also such that that person would be entitled to
make a complaint under the Human Rights Commission Act
1977 or the Race Relations Act 1971 or to exercise a right of
review or appeal, that person may take one, but not more than
one, of the following steps:

“(a) The person may invoke, in relation to those
circumstances, the procedures applicable in relation
to personal grievances under the Labour Relations
Act 1987 or the relevant award or agreement:

“(b) The person may make, in relation to those
circumstances, a complaint under the Human Rights
Commission Act 1977 or the Race Relations Act
1971:

“(c) The person may exercise the right of review or appeal.



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 609

“18p. Superannuation and retiring allowances—(1) For
the purposes of providing superannuation or retiring
allowances for its officers or employees appointed under this
Act, the Commission may from time to time pay sums of
money by way of subsidy or contribution into any scheme
under the National Provident Fund Act 1950 containing
provision for employer subsidy or into any other emFloyer-
subsidised scheme approved by the Minister of Finance for the
purposes of this section.

“(2) Notwithstanding anything in this Act, any person who,
immediately before the commencement of this Act was
assisting the Commission by virtue of an appointment under
section 18 (1) of this Act and was a contributor to the
Government Superannuation Fund under Part II of the
Government Superannuation Fund Act 1956 shall be deemed,
for the purposes of the Government Superannuation Fund Act
1956, to be employed in the Government service so long as that
person continues to be an officer or employee of the
Commission; and that Act shall aplf)Flly to the person in all
respects as if service as such an officer or employee were
Government service. For the purposes of the Government
Superannuation Fund Act 1956, the controlling authority in
relation to any such person shall be the Commission.

“(8) Subject to the Government Superannuation Fund Act
1956, nothing in subsection (2) of this section shall entitle any
person to whom that subsection applies to become a
contributor to the Government Superannuation Fund after
ceasing to be a contributor to that Fund.”

11. Accounts and audit—Section 22 (2) of the principal Act
is hereby amended by omitting the words “31st day of March”,
and substituting the words “30th day of June”.

12. Commission to have regard to economic policies
of Government—Section 26 (1) of the principal Act is hereby
amended by omitting the words “Part V of”.

13. Contracts, arrangements, or understandings
containing exclusionary provisions prohibited—Section
29 of the principal Act is herebty amended by repealing
subsection (1), and substituting the following subsection:

“(1) For the purposes of this Act, a provision of a contract,

arrangement, or understanding is an exclusionary provision
if—



610 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

“(a)It is a provision of a contract or arrangement entered
into, or understanding arrived at, between persons
of whom any 2 or more are in competition with
each other; and

“(b) It has the purpose of preventing, restricting, or limiting
the supply of goods or services to, or the acquisition
of goods or services from, any particular person or
class of persons, either generally or in particular
circumstances or on particular conditions, by all or
any of the parties to the contract, arrangement, or
understanding, or if a party is a body corporate, by a
body corporate that is interconnected with that
party; an

“(c) The particular person or the class of persons to which
the provision relates is in competition with one or
more of the parties to the contract, arrangement or
understanding in relation to the supply or
acquisition of those goods or services.”

14. Use of dominant position in a market—Section 36 of
the principal Act is hereby amended by repealing subsection
(2), and substituting the following subsection:

“(2) For the purposes of this section, a person does not use a
dominant position in a market for any of the purposes specified
in aragra{)]hs (a) to (c) of subsection (1) of this section by reason
only that that person seeks to enforce any statutory intellectual
property right within the meaning of section 45 (2) of this Act
m New Zealand.”

15.Use of dominant position in trans-Tasman
markets—The principal Act is hereby amended by inserting,
after section 36, the t%llowing section:
“86a. (1) No person who has—
“(a) A dominant position in a market; or
“(b) A dominant position in a market in Australia; or
“(c) A dominant position in a market in New Zealand and
Australia—
shall use that person’s dominant position for the purpose of—
“(d) Restricting the entry of any person into any market, not
being a market exclusively for services; or
“(e) Preventing or deterring any person from engaging in
competitive conduct in any market, not being a
market exclusively for services; or
“(f) Eliminating any person from any market, not being a
market exclusively for services.



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 611

“(2) For the purposes of this section, a person does not use a
dominant position in a market for any of the purposes specified
in paragraphs (d) to (f) of subsection (1) of this section by reason
only that that person seeks to enforce any statutory intellectual
property 1152;; within the meaning of section 45 (2) of this Act,
in New Zealand.

*(8) Nothing in this section applies to any practice or conduct
to which this Part of this Act applies that has been authorised
pursuant to Part V of this Act.

16. Exceptions in relation to copyright, patents, plant
varieties, registered designs, and trademarks—(1) The
principal Act is hereby amended by repealing section 45, and
substituting the following section:

*45. (1) Nothing in this Part of this Act, except sections 36,
864, 37, and 38 of this Act, applies—

“(a) To the entering into of a contract or arrangement or

' arriving at an understanding in so far as it contains a

Erovision authorising any act that would otherwise

e prohibited by reason of the existence of a
statutory intellectual property right; or

“(b) To any act done to give effect to a provision of a

contract, arrangement, or understanding referred to
in paragraph (a) of this subsection.

“(2) For the purposes of subsection (1) of this section, a
statutory intellectual property right means a right, privilege, or
entitlement that is conferred, or acknowledged as valid, by or
under—

“(a) The Patents Act 1953; or

“(b) The Designs Act 1953; or

“(c) The Trade Marks Act 1953; or

(d) The Copyright Act 1962; or
“(e) The Plant Variety Rights Act 1987.
(
(

11

“(3) For the purposes of subsection (2) of this section—

“(a) A person who has applied for a patent in accordance
with the Patents Act 1953 and filed the complete
specification in relation to the application shall, until
the application is determined, %e deemed to have
been granted the patent to which the application
relates:

“(b)A person who has made an application for the

registration of a design in accordance with section 7
of the Designs Act 1953 shall, until the application is



612 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

determined, be deemed to be the registered
proprietor of the design:

“(c) A person who has made an application in accordance
with section 26 of the Trade Marks Act 1953 for
registration of a trade mark, shall, until the
application is determined, be deemed to be the
registered proprietor of the trade mark:

“(d) A person who has made an application in accordance
with section 5 of the Plant Variety Rights Act 1987,
shall, until the application is determined, be deemed
to have been granted the plant variety rights to
which the application relates.”

&2) Section 45 of the principal Act, as in force immediately
betore its repeal by subsection (1) of this section, shall continue
in force in relation to any act done to give effect to a provision
of a contract or arrangement entered into, or an understanding
arrived at, before the commencement of this Act.

(8) Subsection (2) of this section expires with the close of the
80th day of June 1991.

17. Section 46 repealed—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing section 46.

18. New Part III substituted—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing Part III, and substituting the following
Part:

“PART III
“BUSINESS ACQUISITIONS

“47. Certain acquisitions prohibited—(1) No person shall
acquire assets of a business or shares if, as a result of the
acquisition,—

“(a) That l-lferson or another person would be, or would be

ikely to be, in a dominant Position in a market; or

“(b) That person’s or another person’s dominant position in a

market would be, or would be likely to be,
strengthened.

“(2) For the purposes of this section and section 48 of this
Act, where 2 or more persons are interconnected or associated
and together are in a dominant position in a market, each of
them is deemed to be in a dominant position in that market.

“(8) For the purposes of this section and section 48 of this
Act, a person is associated with another person if that person is
able, whether directly or indirectly, to exert a su%stantial
degree of influence over the activities of the other.



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 613

“(4) A person is not able to exert a substantial degree of
influence over the activities of another person for the purposes
of subsection (8) of this section, by reason only of the fact
that—

“(a) Those persons are in competition in the same market; or

“(b) One of them supplies goods or services to the other.

“48. Bare transfer of market dominance excluded—
Nothing in section 47 of this Act applies to the acquisition of
assets of a business or shares if—

“(a) Before the acquisition either—

“(i) The person acquiring the assets or shares; or
“(i) The business the assets of which are acquired
or the body corporate in which the shares are
acquired, as the case may be,—
already had a dominant position in a market; and

“(b) The acquisition has not resulted or will not result in the

strengthening of that dominant position.”

19. New sections substituted—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing section 58, and substituting the
following sections:

“58. Commission may grant authorisation for
restrictive trade practices—(1) A person who wishes to enter
into a contract or arrangement, or arrive at an understanding,
to which that person considers section 27 of this Act would
apply, or might apply, may aﬁply to the Commission for an
authorisation to do so and the Commission may grant an
authorisation for that person to enter into the contract or
arrangement, or arrive at the understanding.

“(2) A person who wishes to give effect to a provision of a
contract or arrangement or understanding to which that person
considers section 27 of this Act would apply, or might apply,
may apply to the Commission for an authorisation to do so, and
the Commission may grant an authorisation for that person to
give effect to the provision of the contract or arrangement or
understanding.

“(3) A person who wishes to require the giving of, or to give,
a covenant to which that person considers section 28 of this Act
would apply, or might apply, may apply to the Commission for
an authorisation to do so, and the Commission may grant an
authorisation for that person to require the giving of, or to give,
the covenant.

“(4) A person who wishes to carry out or enforce a covenant
to which that person considers section 28 of this Act would



614 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

apply, or might zt{)ply, may apply to the Commission for an
authorisation to do so, and the Commission may grant an
authorisation for that person to carry out or enforce the
covenant.

“(5) A person who wishes to enter into a contract or
arrangement, or arrive at an understanding to which that
person considers section 29 of this Act would apply, or might
aﬁ)ply, may apply to the Commission for an authorisation for
that person to enter into the contract or arrangement or arrive
at the understanding.

“(6) A person who wishes to give effect to an exclusionary
provision of a contract or arrangement or understanding to
which that person considers section 29 of this Act would apply,
or might apply, may apply to the Commission to do so, and the
Commission may grant an authorisation for that person to give
effect to the exclusionary provision of the contract or
arrangement or understanding.

“(7) A person who wishes to engage in the gractice of resale
price maintenance to which that person considers section 37 of
this Act would apply, or might apply, may apply to the
Commission for an authorisation to do so, and the Commission
may grant an authorisation for that person to engage in the
practice.

“(8) A person who wishes to do an act to which that person
considers section 38 of this Act would apply, or might apply,
may apply to the Commission for an authorisation to do so, and
the Commission may grant an authorisation for that person to
do that act.

“58a. Effect of authorisation—(1) While an authorisation
under subsection (1) or subsection (5) of section 58 of this Act
remains in force, as the case may be, nothing in section 27 or
section 29 of this Act, as the case may be, shall prevent the
applicant from—

“(a) Entering into, or in accordance with the authorisation,
giving effect to or enforcing any provision of the
contract to which the authorisation relates; or

“(b) Entering into, or in accordance with the authorisation,
giving effect to the arrangement to which the
authorisation relates; or

“(c) Arriving at, or in accordance with the authorisation,
giving effect to the understanding to which the
authorisation relates.

“(2) While an authorisation under subsection (2) or subsection

(6) of section 58 of this Act remains in force, as the case may



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 615

be, nothing in section 27 or section 29 of this Act, as the case
may be, shall prevent the applicant from—

“(a) In accordance with the authorisation, giving effect to or
enforcing the contract to which the authorisation
relates; or

“(b) In accordance with the authorisation, giving effect to the
arrangement or understanding.

“(3) While an authorisation under subsection (3) of section 58
of this section remains in force, nothing in section 28 of this Act
shall prevent the applicant from—

“(a) Requiring the giving of, or giving, the covenant to which

the authonsation relates; or

“(b) Carrying out or enforcing the terms of the covenant to
which the authorisation relates in accordance with
the authorisation.

“ﬁ) While an authorisation under subsection (4) of section 58
of this Act remains in force, nothing in section 28 of this Act
shall prevent the applicant from carrying out or enforcing the
terms of the covenant to which the authorisation relates in
accordance with the authorisation.

“ﬁ) While an authorisation under subsection (7) of section 58
of this Act remains in force, nothing in section 37 of this Act
shall prevent the applicant from engaging in the practice to
which the authorisation relates in accordance with the
authorisation.

“Sg) While an authorisation under subsection (8) of section 58
of this Act remains in force, nothing in section 38 of this Act
shall prevent the applicant from doing the act to which the
authorisation relates in accordance with the authorisation.

“588. Additional provisions relating to
authorisations—(1) Every authorisation granted by the
Commission to a person under section 58 ofgtrhis Act to—

“(a) Enter into a contract or arrangement or arrive at an

understanding; or

“(b) Give effect to a provision of a contract, arrangement, or

understanding; or
(c) Require the giving of, or give, a covenant; or

“(d) Carry out or enforce the terms of a covenant; or

“(e) Engage in the practice of resale price maintenance; or

“(f) Do any act referred to in section 38 of this Act,—
shall have egect as if it were also an authorisation in the same
terms to every other person named or referred to in the
application for the authorisation as a party to the contract,
arrangement, or understanding, or the practice or act, or as a

(13



616 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

person who is or would be bound by, or entitled to the benefit
of, the covenant, as the case may be.

“(2) An authorisation granted to a person under section 58 of
this Act may be expressed to apply to or in relation to another
person who,—

“(a) In the case of an authorisation to enter into a contract or
arrangement or arrive at an understanding,
becomes a party to the proposed contract or
arrangement at a time after it is entered into or
becomes a party to the proposed understanding at a
time after it is arrived at:

“(b)In the case of an authorisation to give effect to a
provision of a contract, arrangement, or
understanding, becomes a party to the contract,
arrangement, or understanding at a time after the
authorisation is granted:

“(c) In the case of an authorisation to require the giving of, or
to give, a covenant, becomes bound by, or entitled
to the benefit of, the covenant at a time after the
covenant is given:

“(d) In the case of an authorisation to carry out or enforce
the terms of a covenant, becomes bound by, or
entitled to the benefit of, the covenant at a time
after the authorisation is granted.”

20. Authorisation not to be granted in relation to
contracts, etc., made before determination by
Commission—Section 59 (1) of the principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing paragraph (b), a.m]) substituting the
following paragraphs:

“(b) To require the giving of, or to give a covenant if the
covenant has been given before the Commission
makes a determination in respect of the application
for that authorisation; or

“(c) To engage in the practice of resale price maintenance if
the practice is already being engaged in by the
applicant for the authorisation before the
Commission makes a determination in respect of the
application for that authorisation; or

“(d) To do an act or engage in conduct referred to in section
88 of this Act if rie applicant has done the act or is
:nnagl?ging in the conduct, before the Commission

es a determination in respect of the application
for that authorisation.”



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 617

21. Determination of applications for authorisation of
restrictive trade practices—(1) Section 61 (6) of the principal
Act is hereby amended by omitting the words “under section
58 (1) (a) to (d)”, and substituting the words “pursuant to an
application under section 58 (1) to (4)”.

(2) Section 61 (7) of the principal Act is hereby amended by
omitting the words “under section 58(1)(e) or (f)’, and
substituting the words “pursuant to an application under
section 58 (5) or (6)”.

(8) Section 61 of the principal Act is hereby amended by
adding the following subsection:

“(8) The Commission shall not make a determination

anting an authorisation pursuant to an application under
section 58 (7) or (8) of this Act unless it is satished that—

“(a) The engaging in the practice of resale price maintenance

to which the application relates; or

“J?) The act or conduct to which the application relates—
as the case may be, will in all the circumstances result, or be
likely to result, in such a benefit to the public that—

“(c) The engaging in the practice should be dpermitted; or

“(d) The act or conduct should be permitted.”

22. Section 63 repealed—Section 63 of the principal Act is
hereby repealed.

28. New sections substituted—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing sections 66 to 69 and the heading
immediately preceding those sections, and substituting the
following heaging and sections:

“Business Acquisitions

“66. Commission may give clearances for business
acquisitions—(1) A person who proposes to acquire assets of a
business or shares may give the Commission a notice seeking
clearance for the acquisition.

“(2) Subsections &1), (2) (a) and (b), (4), and (5) of section 60 of
this Act shall a &Z in respect of every notice given under
subsection (1) of this section as if the notice was an application
under section 58 of this Act.

“(8) Within 10 working days after the date of registration of
the notice, or such longer period as the Commission and the
p.tii‘lson who gave the notice agree, the Commission shall
either—

“(a) If it is satisfied that the acquisition will not result in an

effect described in paragraph (a) or paragraph (b) of



618 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

section 47 (1) of this Act, by notice in writing to the
person by or on whose behalf the notice was given,
give a clearance for the acquisition; or
“(b) If it is not satisfied that the acquisition will not result in
an effect described in paragraph (a) or paragraph (b)
of section 47 (1) of this Act, [E))y notice in writing to
the person by or on whose behalf the notice was
given, decline to give a clearance for the acquisition.
“(4)If the period specified in subsection (3) of this section
expires without the Commission having given a clearance for
the acquisition and without having given a notice under
subsection (3) (b) of this section, the Commission shall be
deemed to have declined to give a clearance for the acquisition.
“(5) A clearance given under subsection (3) of this section
explires—
“(a) Twelve months after the date on which it was given; or
“(b)In the event of an appeal being made against the
determination of the Commission giving the
clearance, and the determination being confirmed
by the Court, 12 months after the date on which the
determination is confirmed.

“67. Commission may grant authorisations for
business acquisitions—(1) A person who proposes to acquire
assets of a business or shares may give the Commission a notice
seeking an authorisation for the acquisition.

“(2) Subsections &1), (2) (a) and (b), (4), and (5) of section 60 of
this Act shall apply in respect of every notice given under
subsection (1) o tﬁis section as if the notice was an application
under section 58 of this Act.

“(3) Within 60 working days after the date of registration of
the notice, or such longer period as the Commission and the
person who gave the notice agree, the Commission shall—

“(a) If it is satisfied that the acquisition will not result in an

effect described in paragraph (a) or paragraph (b) of
section 47 (1) of this Act, by notice in writing to the
person by or on whose behalf the notice was given,
give a clearance for the acquisition; or

“(b) If it is satisfied that the acquisition will result, or will be

likely to result, in such a benefit to the public that it
should be permitted, by notice in writing to the
person by or on whose behalf the notice was given,
grant an authorisation for the acquisition; or

“(c)If it is not satisfied as to the matters referred to in

paragraph (a) or paragraph (b) of this subsection, by



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 619

notice in writing to the person by or on whose
behalf the notice was given, decline to give a
clearance or grant an authorisation for the
acquisition.

“(4)If the period specified in subsection (8) of this section
expires without the Commission having given a clearance or
having granted an authorisation or having declined to do so,
the Commission shall be deemed to have declined to give a
clearance or grant an authorisation.

“(5) The Commission shall state in writing its reasons for a
determination made by it under subsection (3) of this section.

“(6) A clearance given or an authorisation granted under
subsection (3) of this section expires—

“(a) Twelve months after the date on which it was given or

granted; or

“(b)In the event of an appeal being made against the

determination of the Commission giving the
clearance or granting the authorisation, and the
determination of the Commission being confirmed
by the Court, 12 months after the date on which the
determination is confirmed.

“68. Provisions applying to applications for clearances
and authorisations for business acquisitions—(1) Every
person who gives a notice under section 66 or section 67 of this
Act shall from time to time produce or, as the case may be,
furnish to the Commission, within such time as it may specify,
such documents and information in relation to the acquisition
as may be required by the Commission for the purpose of
enabling it to exercise its functions under this section or section
66 or section 67 of this Act.

“(2) Notwithstanding section 66 or section 67 of this Act,
where the Commission is of the opinion that a proposed
acquisition is, for reasons other than arisin om the
application of any provision of this Act, ikely to be
proceeded with, the Commission may, in its discretion, decline
to give a clearance or grant an authorisation for that acquisition
under this section.

“(3) The Commission shall state in writing its reasons for
declining to give a clearance or grant an authorisation under
subsection (2) of this section.

“(4) A person who has given a notice in respect of an
acquisition under section 66 or section 67 of this Act may at
any time, by notice in writing to the Commission, advise the
Commission that it does not wish the Commission to give a



620 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

clearance or grant an authorisation and the Commission shall
accordingly not give a clearance or grant an authorisation in
respect of that acquisition.

(5) The Commission may consult with any person who, in
the opinion of the Commission, is able to assist it in making a
determination under section 66 or section 67 of this Act, as the
case may be.

“69. Effect of clearance or authorisation—Nothing in
section 27 or section 47 of this Act applies to the acquisition of
assets of a business or shares if the assets or shares are acquired
in accordance with a clearance or an authorisation and while
the clearance or authorisation is in force.

“69a. Commission may accept undertakings—(1)In
giving a clearance or granting an authorisation under section 66
or section 67 of this Act, the Commission may accept a written
undertaking given by or on behalf of the person who gave a
notice under section 66 (1) or section 67 (1) of this Act, as the
case may be, to dispose of assets or shares specified in the
undertaking.

“(2) The Commission shall not accept an undertakin% in
relation to the giving of a clearance or the granting of an
authorisation ungler section 66 or section 67 of this Act, other
than an undertaking given under subsection (1) of this section.

“(3) An undertaking given to the Commission under
subsection (1) of this section is deemed to form part of the
clearance given or the authorisation granted in relation to the
acquisition to which the undertaking relates.

“698. Conferences in relation to business acqui-
sitions—(1) Before making a determination under section 66
(8) or section 67 (3) of this Act in relation to an acquisition, the
Commission may determine to hold a conference and shall
appoint a date, time, and Flace for the holding of the
conference and give notice of the date, time, and place so
appointed and of the matters to be considered at the
conference to the persons entitled to be present at the
conference.

“(2) The provisions of section 64 of this Act shall apply to
every conference held under this section as if—

“(a) Every reference in that section to a conference called
under section 62 of this Act, were a reference to a
conference held under this section; and

“(b) The reference in subsection tgl) (b) of that section to a
person to whom a draft determination was sent
under section 62 (2) of this Act, were a reference to



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 621

the person by or on whose behalf a notice was given
under section 66 (1) or section 67 (1) of this Act, as
the case may be; and

“(c) The reference in subsection (6) of that section to a
determination in respect of an application, were a
reference to a determination under section 66 gS) or
section 67 (3) of this Act, as the case may be.’

24. Commission may authorise provisional price—
Section 71 of the principal Act is hereby amended by repealing
subsection (1), and substituting the following subsections:

“g’ll) Pending the making of a determination under section 70
of this Act in respect of any controlled goods or services, the
Commission may, by notice in writing to the supplier of those
goods or services, authorise the supply of those goods or
services to any person at a price determined by the
Commission and specified in the notice, on the condition that
the price fixed ancf charged by the supplier for those goods or
services is only a provisional price.

“(1a) For the purposes of subsection (1) of this section, the
Commission may conduct such investigations and consult with
such persons as the Commission considers may assist it to
determine an appropriate provisional price for the supply of
the goods or services.”

25. Jurisdiction of High Court—Section 75 (1) (b) of the
principal Act is herebty amended by repealing subparagraph (i),
and substituting the following subparagraph:

“(ai} Proceedings for the recovery of pecuniary
penalties under section 83 of this Act:”.

26. Lay members of High Court in certain cases—
(1) Section 78 (1) of the principal Act is hereby amended—
(a) By omitting the number “82”, and substituting the
number “85”’; and
(b) By omitting the expression “or 36”, and substituting the
expression “, 36, 36a, or 47”.
(2) Section 78 (8) of the principal Act is hereby amended by
omitting the number “82”, and substituting the number “85”.
(8) Section 78 (4) of the principal Act is hereby amended—
(a) By inserting in paragraph (c), after the expression “section
80”, the expression ‘“or section 83:
(b) By inserting in paragraph (d), after the expression
“section 81”, the expression “or section 84"



622 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

(c) By omitting from paragraph () the words “of this Act”,
and substituting the words “or section 84a of this
Act’:

(d) By adding the following paragraph:
“(f) To exercise the power to make an order directing

the disposal of shares or assets under section
85 of this Act.”.

27. Evidence not otherwise admissible—Section 79 of
the principal Act is hereby amended b)r inserting, after the
expression “section 807, the expression “or section 83”.

28. Pecuniary penalties—Section 80 (1) of the principal
Act is hereby amended—

(a) By omitting the expression “$100,000”, and substituting
the expression “$500,000”; and

(b) By omitting the expression “$300,000”, and substituting
the expression “$5,000,000”.

29. New section substituted—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing section 83 and tﬁe heading above that
section, and substituting the following heading and section:

“Business Acquisitions

“83. Pecunia.rg enalties—(1) If the Court is satisfied on
the application of the Commission that a person—

“(a) Has contravened section 47 of this Act:

“(b) Has attempted to contravene that section:

“(c)Has aided, abetted, counselled, or procured any other
person to contravene that section:

“(d) Has induced, or attempted to induce, any other person,
whether by threats or promises or otherwise, to
contravene that section:

“(e) Has been in any way, directly or indirectly, knowingly
concerned in, or party to, the contravention by any
other person of that section:

“(f) Has conspired with any other person to contravene that
section,—
the Court may order the person to pay to the Crown such
pecuniary (Enenalty as the Court determines to be appropriate,
not exceeding $500,000 in the case of a person not being a
body corporate, or $5,000,000 in the case of a body corporate,
in respect of each such act or omission.



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 623

“(2)In determining an appropriate penalty under this
section, the Court shall have regard to all relevant matters,
including—

“(a) The nature and extent of the act or omission:

“(b) The nature and extent of any loss or damage suffered by

any person as a result of the act or omission:

“(c) The circumstances in which the act or omission took
place:

“(d) Whether or not the person has previously been found by
the Court in proceedings under this Part of this Act
to have engaged in any similar conduct.

;‘1&3 The standard of Froof in proceedings under this section

sh e the standard of proof applying in civil proceedings.

“(4) In any proceedings under this section, the Commission,
upon the order of the Court, may obtain discovery and
administer interrogatories.

“(5) Proceedings under this section may be commenced
within 3 years after the matter giving rise to the contravention
arose.

“(6) A person is not liable to a pecuniary penalty under both
section 80 of this Act and this section in respect of the same
conduct.”

30. Injunctions may be granted by Court for
contravention of Part III—Section 84 of the principal Act is
hereby amended—

(2) By omitting the words “, that a merger or takeover
proposal is being, or has been, implemented in
contravention of section 50”, and substituting the
words “or any other person, that a person intends to
engage, or is engaging, or has engaged, in conduct
that constitutes or would constitute a contravention
of section 47”’; and

(b) By omitting from paragraph (a) the number “50”, and
substituting the number “47”.

31. Actions for damages for contravention of Part III—
The principal Act is hereby amended by inserting, after section
84 (as amended by section 30 of this Act), the following section:

“84a. (1) Eve(rly é)erson is liable in damages for any loss or
damage cause y that person engaging in conduct that
constitutes any of the following:

“(a) A contravention of section 47 of this Act:



624 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

“(b) Aiding, abetting, counselling, or procuring the
contravention of that section:

“(c)Inducing by threats, promises, or otherwise the
contravention of that section:

“(d)Being in any way directly or indirectly, knowingly
concerned in, or party to, the contravention of that
section:

“(e) Cons%iring with any other person in the contravention of
that section:

“(2) An action under subsection (1) of this section may be

commenced at any time within 8 years from the time when the
cause of action arose.”

32. Court may order divestiture of assets or shares in
respect of contravention of Part III—The principal Act is
hereby amended by repealing section 85, and substituting the
following section:

“85. (1) In any case where the Court, on the application of
the Commission, is satisfied that any person—

“(a) Has contravened section 47 of this Act; or

“(b) Has been found in any other proceedings under this Part

of this Act to have contravened section 47 of this
Act,—
it may, by order,—

“(c) Give directions for the disposal by that person of such

assets or shares as shall be specified in the order; or

“(d) Give directions for the disposal by that person of any

assets or shares in accordance with an undertaking
given by the person under section 694 of this Act.

“(2) An application under subsection (1) of this section may
be made at any time within 2 years from the date on which the
contravention occurred.”

33. Persons entitled to appeal—Section 92 of the principal
Act is hereby amended by repealing paragraph (c), and
substituting the following paragraph:

“(c) In the case of an ap(§>eal against a determination of the

Commission under section 66 or section 67 of this
Act in relation to a notice seeking a clearance or an
authorisation, as the case may be,—

“(i) The person who sought the clearance or the
authorisation; and

“(ii) Any person whose assets, or the shares in
which, are proposed to be acquired pursuant to the
clearance or authorisation; and



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 625

“?ii) Any person who participated in any
conterence held by the Commission under section
698 of this Act mn relation to the clearance or
authorisation:”.

34. New sections substituted—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing section 98, and substituting the
following sections:

“98. Commission may require person to supply
information or documents or give evidence—Where the
Commission considers it necessary or desirable for the purposes
of canymg out its functions and exercising its powers under
this Act, the Commission may, by notice in writing served on
any person, require that person—

“(a) To furnish to the Commission, by writing signed by that
person or, in the case of a body corporate, by a
director or competent servant or agent of the body
corporate, within the time and in the manner
specified in the notice, any information or class of
information specified in the notice; or

“(b) To produce to the Commission, or to a person specified
in the notice acting on its behalf in accordance with
the notice, any document or class of documents
specified in the notice; or

“(c) To appear before the Commission at a time and place
specified in the notice to give evidence, either orally
or in writing, and produce any document or class of
documents specified in the notice.

“98a. Power to search—(1) The Commission may, from
time to time, authorise an employee of the Commission to
search under a warrant issued under subsection (2) of this
section any place named in the warrant for the purpose of
ascertaining whether a person has engaged in or is engaging in
conduct that constitutes or may constitute a contravention of
this Act, not being a contravention of section 994 of this Act.

“(2) A District Court Judge, or Justice, or a Court Registrar
(not being a constable) who is satisfied on application made on
oath by a person who is authorised under subsection (1) of this
section that there are reasonable grounds to believe that it is
necessar{1 for the purpose of ascertaining whether or not a
person has engaged in or is engaging in conduct that
constitutes or may constitute a contravention of this Act, not
being a contravention of section 99a of this Act, for an
employee of the Commission to search any place may, by



626 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

warrant, authorise that employee to search a place specified in
the warrant.

“(3) A person who applies for a warrant shall, having made
reasonable inquiries, disclose—

“(a) Details of every previous application for a warrant to
Search the place that the person knows has been
made within the preceding 28 days; and

“(b) The result of the application.

“98s. Powers conferred by warrant—(1) A warrant issued
under section 984 of this Act authorises the person named in
it—

“(a) To enter and search the place specified in the warrant on
one occasion within 30 days of the date of issue of
the warrant at a time that is reasonable in the
circumstances:

“(b) To use such assistance as is reasonable in the
circumstances:

“(c) To use such force for gaining entry and for breaking
open any article or thing as is reasonable in the
circumstances:

“(d) To search for and remove documents or any article or
thing that the person executing the warrant believes
on reasonable grounds may be relevant:

“(e) Where necessary, to take copies of documents, or
extracts from documents, that the person executing
the warrant believes on reasonable grounds may be
relevant:

“(f) Where necessary, to require a person to reproduce, or
assist any person executing the warrant to
reproduce, in usable form, information recorded or
stored in a document.

“(2LA person assisting the person executing the warrant also
has the powers referred to in paragraphs (c), (d), and (e) of
subsection (1) of this section.

“(8) The warrant shall be executed in accordance with such
reasonable conditions as may be specified in the warrant when
it is issued.

“98c. Warrant to be produced—A person executing a
warrant issued under section 98A of this Act—

“(a) Must have the warrant with him or her; and

“(b) Must produce it on initial entry and, if requested, at any

subsequent time; and



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 627

“(c) Must identify himself or herself to the owner or occupier
or person in charge of the place if that person is
present; and

“(d) Must produce evidence of his or her identity.

“98p. Other duties of person who executes a warrant—
(1) A person who executes a warrant issued under section 98a
of this Act must, before completing the search, leave in a
prominent place at the place searched,—

“(a) In the case of a search carried out at a time when the
OWner or occupier was not present, a written notice
stating,—

“(i) The date and time when the warrant was
executed; and

“(ii) The name of the person who executed the
warrant; and

“(b) In the case of a search where a document or article or
thing was removed from the place being searched, a
schedule of documents or articles or things that
were removed during the search.

“(2)If it is not practicable to prepare a schedule before
completing the search, or if the owner or occupier of the place
being searched consents, the person executing the warrant—

“(a) May, instead of leaving a schedule, leave a notice stating
that documents, or articles, or things have been
removed during the search and that, within 7 days
of the search, a schedule will be delivered, left, or
sent stating what documents, articles, or things have
been removed; and

“(b) Must, within 7 days of the search,—

“(i) Deliver a schedule to the owner or occupier;
or
“(ii} Leave a schedule in a prominent position at
the place searched; or
“(iii) Send a schedule by mail to the owner or
occupier of the place searched.
“(3) Every schedule must state—
“(a) The documents, articles, and things that have been
removed; and
“(b) The location from where they were removed; and
“(c) The location where they are being held.

“98e. Duty to assist—The occupier or person in charge of
the place that a person authorised pursuant to a warrant issued
under section 98a of this Act enters for the purpose of



628 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

searching must provide that person with all reasonable facilities
and assistance in executing the warrant.

“98r. Power to inspect and take copies of documents,
etc.—The Commission, or any person authorised by the
Commission for the purpose, may inspect and take copies of
any documents or extracts from them obtained pursuant to a
warrant issued under section 98a of this Act.

“98c. Commission may exercise powers notwith-
standing other proceedings—The Commission may exercise
any power under sections 98 to 98 of this Act notwithstanding
that any proceedings, whether under Part VI of this Act or
otherwise, have been instituted in any Court.

“98H. Supply of information and documents in relation
to section 36a—(1) Where the Commission considers it
necessary or desirable for the purposes of carrying out its
functions and exercising its powers under this Act in relation to
section 36a of this Act, the Commission may by notice in
writing served on any person who is ordinarily resident in
Australia or who carries on business in Australia, require that
person—

“(a) To furnish to the Commission, by writing signed by that
person or, in the case of a body corporate, by a
director or competent servant or agent of the body
corporate, within the time and in the manner
specified in the notice, any information or class of
information specified in the notice; or

“(b) To produce to the Commission, or to a person specified
in the notice acting on its behalf in accordance with
the notice, any document or class of documents
specified in the notice.

“(2) A person who is required to furnish information or a
class of mformation or produce any document or class of
documents to the Commission pursuant to this section complies
with this section if that person Exmishes the information or that
class of information or produces the document or that class of
documents to the Australian Trade Practices Commission in
accordance with the Trade Practices Act 1974.”

85. Powers of Commission to take evidence—Section 99
(3) of the principal Act is hereby amended by omitting the
expression 98 (1) (c)”, and substituting the expression “98 (c)”.

36. Commission may receive information and
documents on behalf of Australian Trade Practices



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 629

Commission—The princg)lal Act is hereby amended by
inserting, after section 99, the following section:

“99a. (1) Where the Al(;stralian Trade Practilses Commission
requires any person resident or carrying on business in New
Zeg.land to %,mglish any information or angy class of information
or produce any document or class of documents to it pursuant
to section 155a of the Trade Practices Act 1974, the
information or class of information may be furnished or the
document or class of documents may be produced to the
Commission for transmission to the Australian Trade Practices
Commission.

“(2) The Commission shall deliver the information or class of
information furnished or the document or class of documents
produced to it to the Australian Trade Practices Commission as
soon as practicable.

“(3) Every person who—

“(a) Refuses or fails, without reasonable excuse, to comply
with a requirement referred to in subsection (1) of
this section; or

“(b)In purported compliance with such a requirement,

ishes information or produces a document
knowing it to be false or misleading—
commits an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a
fine not exceeding $10,000 in the case of an individual, or
$30,000 in the case of a body corporate.”

87. Offences—The pn'nci%al Act is hereby amended by
repealing section 103, and substituting the following section:

“103. (1) No person shall—
“(a) Without reasonable excuse, refuse or fail to comply with
a notice under section 98 of this Act; or
“(b)In purported compliance with such a notice, furnish
information, or produce a document, or give
evidence, knowing it to be false or misleading; or
“(c) Resist, obstruct, or delay an employee of the
Commission acting fpursuant to a warrant issued
under section 98a of this Act.
“(2) No person shall attempt to deceive or knowingly mislead
the Commiission in relation to any matter before it.
“(8) No person, having been required to appear before the
Commission pursuant to section 98 (c) of this Act, shall—
“(a) Without reasonable excuse, refuse or fail to appear
before the Commission to give evidence; or



630 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

“(b) Refuse to take an oath or make an affirmation as a
witness; or
“(? Refuse to answer any question; or
“(d) Refuse to produce to the Commission any book or
document that that person is required to produce.

“(4) Any person who contravenes subsection (1) or subsection

{]22 or subsection (3) of this section commits an offence and is

iable on summary conviction to a fine not exceeding $10,000

in the case of an individual, or $30,000 in the case of a body

corporate.”

38. Delegation by Commission—Section 105 (1) of the
principal Act is hereby amended by omitting the words “grant
a clearance or”.

89. Proceedings privileged—Section 106 of the (frincipal
Act is hereby amended by repealing subsections (4) and (5), and
substituting the following subsections:

“(4) A person shall not be excused from complying with any
requirement to furnish information, produce documents, or
give evidence under this Act, or, on appearing before the
Commission, from answering any question or producing any
document, on the ground that to do so might tend to
incriminate that person or that person’s spouse.

“(52)A statement made by a person in answer to a question
put by or before the Commission shall not in criminal
proceedings or in proceedings under section 80 or section 83 of
this Act, be admussible against that person, or that person’s
spouse.”

40. Judicial notice—The principal Act is hereby amended
by inserting, after section 106, the following section:

“106A. For the purposes of this Act, judicial notice shall be

taken in all courts and for all purposes of—
“(a) The common seal of the Commission:
“(b) The signature of an person holding, or who has held,
office as the Chairman, Deputy Chairman, or a
member of the Commission on a document that
appears to be a document made on behalf of the
Commission:
“(c) The official seal of the Australian Trade Practices
Commission:

“(d) The official signature of any person holding, or who has
held, office as the Chairman, Deputy Chairman, or a
member, of the Australian Trade Practices



1990, No. 41 Commerce Amendment 631

Commission on a document that appears to be a
document made on behalf of that Commission.”

41. Annual report—Section 107 (1) of the principal Act is
hereby amended y omitting the words “81st day of March”,
and substituting the words “30th day of June”.

42. Regulations—Section 108 of the principal Act is hereby
amended by inserting, after paragraph (c), the following
aragraphs:

“(ca) Authorising the Commission in its discretion, or on such
ounds as may be prescribed, to refund a part of
the prescribed fee paid by a person who gives a
notice under section 67 (1) of this Act in any case
where the Commission gives a clearance under that

section:
“(cb) Authorising the Commission to refund a part of the
prescribed fee paid by a person on an application
under section 70 (1) of this Act in any case where a
written undertaking is obtained or accepted from

that Jperson in accordance with section 72 of this
Act.’

43. Transitional provisions repealed—(1) Sections 112 to
115 of the principal Act are hereby repealed.

(2) The repeal of sections 112 to 115 of the principal Act by
subsection (1) of this section does not affect the validity of
anything done pursuant to, or effected by, the enactments
repealed.

44. First Schedule repealed—The principal Act is hereby
amended by repealing the First Schedule (as amended by
section 83 of the Broadcasting Act 1989).

45. Human Rights Commission Act 1977 amended—
Section 69 of the Human Rights Commission Act 1977 is
hereby amended by repealing subsections (3) and (4), and
substituting the following subsections:

“(3) Nothing in this Part of this Act shall limit or affect the
Commerce Act 1986 and where any complaint, in relation to
any organisation which exists for the purposes of members who
carry on a particular profession, trade, or calling, or in relation
to any ofhicer, agent of, or other person connected with an
such organisation, is made under section 68 of this Act wit
respect to a matter which may, wholly or in part, be
investigated under the Commerce Act 1986, the Commission
shall refer that complaint to the Commerce Commission
pursuant to that Act.



632 Commerce Amendment 1990, No. 41

“(4) The Commission shall not investigate or institute any
proceedings with respect to a complaint of a kind referred to in
subsection (3) of this section except to the extent that the
Commerce Commission has certified that the matter or part of
the matter is not able to be, or has not been, dealt with,
determined, or disposed of in accordance with the Commerce
Act 1986.”

46. Consequential amendment to Broadcasting Act
1989—Section 83 of the Broadcasting Act 1989 is hereby
consequentially repealed.

47. Amendment to Radiocommunications Act 1989—
Section 138 of the Radiocommunications Act 1989 is hereby
amended b rePea.Ijng subsection (1), and substituting the
following subsection:

“(1) Subject to subsections (2) and (8) of this section, for the
purposes of section 47 of the Commerce Act 1986,
management rights in relation to radio frequencies and licences
created under section 48 of this Act s be deemed to be
assets of a business.”

48. Transitional provisions in relation to mergers and
takeovers—Notwithstanding the repeals and amendments
effected by this Act,—

(a) The provisions of the principal Act that were in force
immediately before the 1st day of January 1991 shall
apply in relation to every notice given under section
66 or section 67 of that Act as in force immediately
before that date and to every clearance given or
authorisation granted in relation to the proposal to
which the notice relates as if this Act had not been

assed:
(b) Witlﬁ)ut limiting paragraph (a) of this section, every
clearance given and ev authorisation granted

under section 66 or section 67 of the principal Act as
in force immediately before the 1st day of Janu.
1991 or as continued in force by virtue of paragrap
(a) of this section is deemed to be a clearance or an
authorisation to which section 69 of the principal Act
(as inserted by section 23 of this Act) applies.

This Act is administered in the Ministry of Commerce.

WELLINGTON, NEW ZEALAND: Published under the authority of the
New Zealand Government—1998



