
358 Auckland Harbour Bridge Amendment 1958, No. 29 

ANALYSIS 

Title 4. Bridge not road or street 

1

3. Bylaws 

1. Short Title 
2. Tolls 

5. Penalties 
6. Unauthorised expenditure 

1958, No. 29 

An Act to amend the Auckland Harbour Bridge Act 1950 
[23 September 1958 

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand 
in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, 
as follows: 

1. Short Title-This Act may be cited as the Auckland 
Harbour Bridge Amendment Act 1958, and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Auckland Harbour 
Bridge Act 1950 (hereinafter referred to as the principal 
Act). 

2. Tolls-( 1) Section two of the principal Act is hereby 
amended by repealing the definition of the term "toll", and 
substituting the following definition: 

"'Toll' means any reward or payment which the 
Authority is authorised to collect under this Act in 
respect of any traffic over the bridge authorised by 
this Act or by regulations or bylaws under this Act:". 

(2) Section forty-four of the principal Act is hereby 
amended by omitting the words "persons, vehicles, and 
animals", and substituting the word "vehicles". 

(3) Section forty-seven of the principal Act is hereby 
amended by omitting the words "animal or vehicle", and 
substituting the word "vehicle". 



1958, No. 29 Auckland Harbour Bridge Amendment 359 

3. Bylaws-Section fifty-five of the principal Act is 
hereby amended as follows: 

( a) By repealing paragraphs (c) and (d), and substituting 
the following paragraphs: 

..;. 

" ( c) Regulating the speed, times, and manner at 
or in which vehicles or any class of vehicles may be 
driven on to, over, or off the bridge: 

" ( d) Classifying traffic and regulating or pro­
hibiting the use of the bridge by any class or classes 
of traffic or by persons or animals not conveyed in 
vehicles:": 

(b) By adding to paragraph (h) the words "by vehicles 
according to the type or class of the vehicles": 

( c) By omitting from paragraph (i) the word "using", 
and substituting the words "in respect of the use of". 

4. Bridge not road or street-Section thirty-six A of the 
principal Act, as inserted by section five of the Auckland 
Harbour Bridge Amendment Act 1956, is hereby amended 
by omitting from subsection two the words "a public high­
way", and substituting the words "a road or street". 

5. Penalties-( 1) Section sixty-one of the principal Act is 
hereby amended by omitting the words "twenty pounds", 
and substituting the words "fifty pounds". 

(2) Subsection two of section eighty-two of the principal 
Act is hereby amended by omitting the words "one hundred 
pounds", and substituting the words "fifty pounds". 

6. Unauthorised expenditure-( 1) Section seventy-four of 
the principal Act is hereby amended by repealing the proviso 
thereto, as added by section twenty-one of the Finance Act 
(No. 2) 1953, and substituting the following proviso: 

"Provided that if the amount authorised by the foregoing 
provisions of this section is less than three hundred and fifty 
pounds for any year, the Authority may in that year expend 
as aforesaid a sum or sums not amounting in the whole to 
more than three hundred and fifty pounds." 

(2) Section twenty-one of the Finance Act (No. 2) 1953 
is hereby repealed. 

(3) This section shall be deemed to have come into force on 
the first day of April, nineteen hundred and fifty-seven. 


