
FROM THE EDITOR 

Welcome to the 15th issue of ReSolution® in which we draw on 
the experience and knowledge of leading experts in the field to 
bring you commentary, articles and reviews on topical matters 
relating to domestic and international dispute resolution. 

In this issue, we feature mediation. We also look at arbitration of 
trust disputes, third party funding for International Arbitration in 
Asia, refusal by PRC Court to enforce an award made under SIAC 
e><pedited procedures, India takes a step back when Supreme 
Court allows employee of a party to act as arbitrator, the position 
vis-a-vis awards against non-parties to arbitration agreements in 
Singapore; requirement for reasons in an arbitral award to be 
sufficiently full in order to discharge tribunal's mandate to give a 
reasoned award; and more. 

I wish to take this opportunity to thank all our contributors. We are 
most grateful for the support we receive from dispute resolution 
professionals, Law firms, and publishers, locally and overseas, that 
allows us to share with you papers and articles of a world-class 
standard, and to bring you a broad perspective on the Law and 
evolving trends in the delivery and practice of domestic and 
international dispute resolution. 

Contributions of articles, papers and commentary for future issues 
of Resolution® are always welcome. I do hope you find this issue 
interesting and useful. Please feel free to distribute ReSolution® 
to your friends and colleagues - they are most welcome to contact 
us if they wish to receive our publications directly. 

Wishing you all a safe and enjoyable holiday season and a 
successful and prosperous New Vear from all of us at NZDRC. 

John Green 

Editor 
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